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TENDER NOTICE FOR HIRING OF TAXIS/CARS

KHADT & WLIAGE INDUSTRIES COMMISSION

STATE OFFICE, BHUBANESWAR
No. OSO/Hiring of Vehicle/HK/2022-23  Date:02.12.2022

Sealed tenders are invited from reputed Tour and Travel

Agencies located in Bhubaneswar (Odisha) for hiring Air

Conditioned/Non-Air Conditioned Taxis/Cars for official use

of State Office, Khadi & Village Industries Commission,

Ministry of MSME, Govt. of India, J-16, Bhimpur,

Gandamunda, Khandagiri, Bhubaneswar - 30 (Tel.: 0674-

2351161, 2351131) for one year.

The bid may be submitted in a sealed cover superscribed as

“BID FOR HIRING OF TAXIS/CARS SERVICES” by Speed

Post to the undersigned at the above mentioned address. The

important dates of tender are mentioned below.

a) Date of issue of Tender . 5th December, 2022
document

b) Last date and time for
submission of tender
document

c) Date and time for opening of
(i} Technical Bid document

. 26th December, 2022
(Upto 2.00 P.M.)

. 26th Decmber, 2022

(at 3.00 P.M.)
. 26th Decmber, 2022

(at 5.00 P.M.)
For the detail tender Notice please visit KVIC website i.e.
www.kvic.org.in/Tender. It can also be obtained from this
office on any working day between 10.00 A.M. to 5.00 P.M.
(except Saturday, Sunday, Public Holidays & Lunch hours
(1.30 P.M. to 2.00 P.M.)) at the above mentioned address by
paying Demand Draft for Rs.1,000/- (Rupees one thousand
only) drawn in favour of Director, KVIC, Bhubaneswar.
State Director

(ii) Financial Bid document
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OFFICE OF THE
COLLECTOR & DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, KHORDHA

(SOCIAL SECURITY SECTION)
Notice No. 6373/Dated. 02.12.2022

Notice

No. gg-22:- Applications are invited in prescribed format
from intending and eligible NGOs 1o run a 30 bedded Drug
De-addiction Centre and Physiotherapy Unit at Integrated|
Infrastructure  Complex, Khudupur, Jatni under Khordha
district. The last date for receipt of application is 15.12.2022 by
5.00 P.M. The details of the applications along with Guideline
for setting up of 30 Bedded Drug De-addiction Centre and
Physiotherapy Unit may be downloaded from the website

www.khordha.nic.in
By Order of Collector,
Sd./- Collector & District Magistrate, Khordha
OIPR-46001/11/0030/2223

No.0-1381:

@ OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS CIRCLE, SUNABEDA
E-mail: serwsbd2003@yahoo com

e-Procurement Notice for bridge works

1. Name of the Work: Construction of bridges as per Annexure (2 Nos)

2. Class of Contractor: “A” & Special Class of (Odisha PWD) or relevant class of other licensing authority.

2UIEAIF Q6N AR BG4Sl QRGN
26Q 62F6Q 7 FIRER LRI
ARRENER 6ACNRE ANRQ ATNR
AAFEQ ACPOR @ QLRI ILIQ AN
R QRGN | 604 I@ 699 ARIFER
g AR QG, AR 6
ANGT YUK, FERIRF1, BN
AR B ARG, KRG 2AIFRAQ,
RIFRS QEAIS Ie° 2R DILSG

LN GQLQQI NQ°
AYRIR AARER 699 oK

E6RETQ G 6RINUYS
@RIER 6N 64

ARER DNGT AN R G
QIR 9RIR QAU 6a1M 61 YR
canelm| Gg2l @Tl, ALY G

QYo QTR Ao ABR F1YIAR

Qad @ @@l@\’lg\@ Qi‘g@ﬂl@l 4. Details projects as per Annexufe attached: _ .
—~ ~ Procurement Bid Availability of Tender Last date & Date & Time of

O QQS@, GQ%Q amlQ Officer Identification online for bidding time of seek- opening of tender
=g RICG T No. From To ing tender | Technical | Financial
Ag@ ¢ QI 9% G &ala QG‘ clarification Bid Bid
onl 6RUINIgEl R/ gEIFRIER i 2 3 4 5 6 7

3 A = = Chief Construction | CCERWCSBD-|09.12.2022 |29.12.2022| 28.12.2022 |30.12.2022| To be
g GQQ SSlImID | Q@I@\’]Q@ Engineer, Rural Works Online- at upto upto 2.00 PM at intimated
B @. QA9 TSR gg@_ 2y Circle, Sunabeda 34/2022-23 11.00AM. | 530PM 11.00 AM | separately

Rl B geIdeq kI 6a9 Qg
QAT 69IM 64 6V K6 |

3. Estimated Cost: Varies from Rs.395.04 lakhs to Rs.790.61 Lakhs (Approximately)

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA

5. The details of works can be seen from the website https://www.tendersodisha.gov.in.
6. Any Corrigendum/Addendum will be displayed in the above e-tender website.

OIPR-25182/11/0042/2223

Sd./- Chief Construction Engineer, Rural Works Circle, Sunabeda

&3%

No.A-819:
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GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
RENGALI LEFT BANK CANAL DIVISION, AT/P.O. Kamakhyanagar
Dist: Dhenkanal, Odisha, PIN-759018 Ph:06769-270771
Email ID - eerlbcdivision@gmail.com

e-PROCUREMENT NOTICE No. RLBCD-P.-03/2022-23

Category of Work

"Civil Construction Works".

1
2 |[Total No. of Works
3

05 (Five) Nos.

Estimated Cost

Varies from Rs.13.40 Lakhs to Rs.5.73
Lakhs

Period of Completion

30 Days to 45 Days

Class of Contractor

"D" & "C" or equivalent grade/class

DO

Mode of Payment

Cost of Bid Document /

Varies Rs. 6.000/- to Rs.4,000/-
(Non-Refundable) / Online through
Electronic Payment Mode (Internet
Banking/ NEFT/RTGS of Designated
Banks and their Aggregator Banks).

Payment

7 {EMD / Bid Security
Amount / Mode of

No Bid Security/ Earnest Money Deposit
(EMD) has to be deposited and all
participating bidder shall submit "Bid
Security Declaration".

8 |Other details:

AR 90 A ORI AN FAUAIRS |
geg @dld QPe AeR gag
QTR 696! Gl QI RS
Q@ Jag GAI8 QI8Q 6969 1 909N
QA 9¥6Q 689 IS FIIIER IR 62IRQl
QRINQIQ! 6291 Q06 F0Q AR
Q71 SN 9ge 6291 E6a A9
6OLIQEIR
QEER | AFIRT CIEA GIE 2ATAQ,
RS 2R (36), 6aa, N6

JIRERQ ARAG @RI 66K,
2llEl QeTl, TR KA, GBI 2
Qde ARG QI Afee, FgleNn
ggs @7cQ A QU QLR
6R0R6Q 60QC 679Q AGMS
@4R, ATHIAQ IR0 2! GRIEH,
200g @fdea  Qdiaedn
3Q19, 31 9O6 CRARYIR 2FIEAS
6901, I6 QTR AQS ALIZ, 1e°
A0g BIQ REJ6ATR RAYE 2I6M |

(i) Procurement Officer

Superintending Engineer, Rengali Left
Bank Canal Division, Kamakhyanagar.

(if)
Documents
Bidding.

Availability of Bid
Online

07.12.2022 from 10.00 Hours to
19.12.2022 upto 17.00 Hours.

(iii).Date, time

(Online)

&

venue of Bid Opening

On 21.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
Olo the Superintending Engineer,
Rengali Left Bank Canal Division,
Kamakhyanagar(through online).

required

(iv) Date, time & venue
of transparent lottery
for finalization of bids, if

On 27.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
Olo the Superintending Engineer,
Rengali Left Bank Canal Division,
Kamakhyanagar.

qge

“Further details can be seen from the Government of Odisha
website https://tendersodisha.gov.in.

OIPR-32298/11/0003/2223

Sd./- Superintending Engineer
R.L.B. Canal Division
Kamakhyanagar

File No.ZP-28011/3/2022-ORMAS SEC-ZP-ZILLA PARISHAD
‘ ORMAS

(Odisha Rural Development and Marketing Society)
Panchayati Raj and Drinking Water Department

Tel:06724-231752, Fax:06724-231752 (URL:www.ormas.org),

E-mail:dsmsjagatsinghpur@gmail.com

ORMAS, JAGATSINGHPUR

A District unit of ORMAS
Office of the Zilla Parishad,
Jagatsinghpur,Sanra, Nalibar-754104

A
e/

Order No.282/ Date:03.12.2022

TENDER CALL NOTICE

No.CAD-4015: Sealed tenders are inviting from reputed Firms/
Agency/ Organisation for procurement of different works like
Tantage and Allied works, Still Photography & Videography
and Printing works towards organisation of Zilla Mahotsav
“Kallola-2023 & Pallishree Mela to be held on 15th to 21st Jan,
2023 at Nabakrushna Choudhury Stadium, Jagatsinghpur.

The tender paper alongwith the details specification
and eligibility criteria of the above works will be available
in the office of ORMAS, Jagatsinghpur, Clo- ZP,
Jagatsinghpur from 3rd to 13th Dec, 2022 by 12.30 PM
or tender paper can be downloaded from www.ormas.org.
The sealed tenders will be opened in the Office Chamber
of CDO-cum-EO, ZP, Jagatsinghpur on the same date
(Date:13.12.22) at 5.00 PM in the presence of the Bidders
or their authorised representative.

The undersigned reserves the right to accept or
reject any or all the tenders without assigning any reason

thereof.
Sd./- Collector & DM
Jagatsinghpur

OIPR-19004/11/0008/2223
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OFFICE OF THE
COLLECTOR & DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, KHORDHA

(SOCIAL SECURITY SECTION)
Notice No. 6373/Dated. 02.12.2022

Notice

No. gg-22:- Applications are invited in prescribed format
from intending and eligible NGOs 1o run a 30 bedded Drug
De-addiction Centre and Physiotherapy Unit at Integrated|
Infrastructure  Complex, Khudupur, Jatni under Khordha
district. The last date for receipt of application is 15.12.2022 by
5.00 P.M. The details of the applications along with Guideline
for setting up of 30 Bedded Drug De-addiction Centre and
Physiotherapy Unit may be downloaded from the website

www.khordha.nic.in
By Order of Collector,
Sd./- Collector & District Magistrate, Khordha
OIPR-46001/11/0030/2223

No.0-1381:

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA

k@ OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS CIRCLE, SUNABEDA

E-mail: serwsbd2003@yahoo com
e-Procurement Notice for bridge works
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1. Name of the Work: Construction of bridges as per Annexure (2 Nos)

2. Class of Contractor: “A” & Special Class of (Odisha PWD) or relevant class of other licensing authority.
3. Estimated Cost: Varies from Rs.395.04 lakhs to Rs.790.61 Lakhs (Approximately)

4. Details projects as per Annexure attached:

Procurement Bid Availability of Tender Last date & Date & Time of
Officer Identification online for bidding time of seek- opening of tender
No. From To ing tender | Technical | Financial
clarification Bid Bid
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Chief Construction | CCERWCSBD-|09.12.2022 29.12.2022{ 28.12.2022 |30.12.2022| Tobe
Engineer, Rural Works Online- at upto upto 2.00 PM at intimated
Circle, Sunabeda 34/2022-23 11.00AM. | 5.30 PM 11.00 AM | separately

5. The details of works can be seen from the website https://www.tendersodisha.gov.in.
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6. Any Corrigendum/Addendum will be displayed in the above e-tender website.

Sd./- Chief Construction Engineer, Rural Works Circle, Sunabeda

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
RENGALI LEFT BANK CANAL DIVISION, AT/P.O. Kamakhyanagar
Dist: Dhenkanal, Odisha, PIN-759018 Ph:06769-270771
No.A-819: Email ID - eerlbcdivision@gmail.com

e-PROCUREMENT NOTICE No. RLBCD-P.-03/2022-23

&3%

"Civil Construction Works".

05 (Five) Nos.

Varies from Rs.13.40 Lakhs to Rs.5.73
Lakhs

Period of Completion |30 Days to 45 Days

Class of Contractor "D" & "C" or equivalent grade/class

Cost of Bid Document /{Varies Rs. 6.000/- to Rs.4,000/-
Mode of Payment (Non-Refundable) / Online through
Electronic Payment Mode (Internet
Banking/ NEFT/RTGS of Designated
Banks and their Aggregator Banks).

7 {EMD / Bid Security{No Bid Security/ Earnest Money Deposit
Amount / Mode off{(EMD) has to be deposited and all
Payment participating bidder shall submit "Bid
Security Declaration".

1 |Category of Work
2 |[Total No. of Works
3 |Estimated Cost

DO

8 |Other details:
(i) Procurement Officer

Superintending Engineer, Rengali Left
Bank Canal Division, Kamakhyanagar.
07.12.2022 from 10.00 Hours to
19.12.2022 upto 17.00 Hours.

(i)  Availability of Bid
Documents Online
Bidding.
(iii).Date, time &
venue of Bid Opening
(Online)

On 21.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
Olo the Superintending Engineer,
Rengali Left  Bank Canal Division,
Kamakhyanagar(through online).

(iv) Date, time & venue{On 27.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
of transparent lottery{O/o the Superintending Engineer,
for finalization of bids, iffRengali Left Bank Canal Division,
required Kamakhyanagar.

“Further details can be seen from the Government of Odisha
website https://tendersodisha.gov.in.
Sd./- Superintending Engineer
R.L.B. Canal Division
Kamakhyanagar

OIPR-32298/11/0003/2223

File No.ZP-28011/3/2022-ORMAS SEC-ZP-ZILLA PARISHAD
‘ ORMAS

(Odisha Rural Development and Marketing Society)
Panchayati Raj and Drinking Water Department

Tel:06724-231752, Fax:06724-231752 (URL:www.ormas.org),

E-mail:dsmsjagatsinghpur@gmail.com

ORMAS, JAGATSINGHPUR

A District unit of ORMAS
Office of the Zilla Parishad,
Jagatsinghpur,Sanra, Nalibar-754104

A
e/

Order No.282/ Date:03.12.2022

TENDER CALL NOTICE

No.CAD-4015: Sealed tenders are inviting from reputed Firms/
Agency/ Organisation for procurement of different works like
Tantage and Allied works, Still Photography & Videography
and Printing works towards organisation of Zilla Mahotsav
“Kallola-2023 & Pallishree Mela to be held on 15th to 21st Jan,
2023 at Nabakrushna Choudhury Stadium, Jagatsinghpur.

The tender paper alongwith the details specification
and eligibility criteria of the above works will be available
in the office of ORMAS, Jagatsinghpur, Clo- ZP,
Jagatsinghpur from 3rd to 13th Dec, 2022 by 12.30 PM
or tender paper can be downloaded from www.ormas.org.
The sealed tenders will be opened in the Office Chamber
of CDO-cum-EO, ZP, Jagatsinghpur on the same date
(Date:13.12.22) at 5.00 PM in the presence of the Bidders
or their authorised representative.

The undersigned reserves the right to accept or
reject any or all the tenders without assigning any reason

thereof.
Sd./- Collector & DM
Jagatsinghpur

OIPR-19004/11/0008/2223
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OFFICE OF THE

COLLECTOR & DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, KHORDHA

(SOCIAL SECURITY SECTION)
Notice No. 6373/Dated. 02.12.2022

Notice

No. gg-22:- Applications are invited in prescribed format
from intending and eligible NGOs 1o run a 30 bedded Drug
De-addiction Centre and Physiotherapy Unit at Integrated|
Infrastructure  Complex, Khudupur, Jatni under Khordha
district. The last date for receipt of application is 15.12.2022 by
5.00 P.M. The details of the applications along with Guideline
for setting up of 30 Bedded Drug De-addiction Centre and
Physiotherapy Unit may be downloaded from the website
www.khordha.nic.in
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By Order of Collector,
Sd./- Collector & District Magistrate, Khordha
OIPR-46001/11/0030/2223

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA

@ OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS CIRCLE, SUNABEDA

E-mail:serwsbd2003@yahoo.com

No.0O-1381:
1. Name of the Work: Construction of bridges as per Annexure (2 Nos)

2. Class of Contractor: “A” & Special Class of (Odisha PWD) or relevant class of other licensing authority.

e-Procurement Notice for bridge works

3. Estimated Cost: Varies from Rs.395.04 lakhs to Rs.790.61 Lakhs (Approximately)

4. Details projects as per Annexure attached:

Procurement Bid Availability of Tender Last date & Date & Time of
Officer Identification online for bidding time of seek- opening of tender
No. From To ing tender | Technical | Financial
clarification Bid Bid
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Chief Construction | CCERWCSBD-|09.12.2022 29.12.2022{ 28.12.2022 |30.12.2022| Tobe
Engineer, Rural Works Online- at upto upto 2.00 PM at intimated
Circle, Sunabeda 34/2022-23 11.00AM. | 5.30 PM 11.00 AM | separately

5. The details of works can be seen from the website https://www.tendersodisha.gov.in.

6. Any Corrigendum/Addendum will be displayed in the above e-tender website.
OIPR-25182/11/0042/2223 Sd./- Chief Construction Engineer, Rural Works Circle, Sunabeda
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ol GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
g DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
RENGALI LEFT BANK CANAL DIVISION, AT/P.O. Kamakhyanagar
Dist: Dhenkanal, Odisha, PIN-759018 Ph:06769-270771
No.A-819: Email ID - eerlbcdivision@gmail.com

e-PROCUREMENT NOTICE No. RLBCD-P.-03/2022-23

File No.ZP-28011/3/2022-ORMAS SEC-ZP-ZILLA PARISHAD
‘ ORMAS

Panchayati Raj and Drinking Water Department
Tel:06724-231752, Fax:06724-231752 (URL:www.ormas.org),
E-mail:dsmsjagatsinghpur@gmail.com

ORMAS, JAGATSINGHPUR

A District unit of ORMAS
Office of the Zilla Parishad,

"Civil Construction Works".

05 (Five) Nos.

Varies from Rs.13.40 Lakhs to Rs.5.73
Lakhs

1 |Category of Work
2 |[Total No. of Works
3 |Estimated Cost

4 |Period of Completion {30 Days to 45 Days
Ga |a1 sﬂﬂl 5 |Class of Contractor __ |"D" & "C" or equivalent grade/class Jagatsinghpu r,Sanra, Nalibar-754104
6 iCost of Bid Document /[Varies Rs. 6.000/- to Rs.4,000/-
Mode of Payment (Non-Refundable) / Online through Order No.282/ Date:03.12.2022

ﬁﬁ@,’&le 9(@.QQ,Q.) Electronic Payment Mode (Internet
Banking/ NEFT/RTGS of Designated
Banks and their Aggregator Banks).

7 {EMD / Bid Security{No Bid Security/ Earnest Money Deposit
Amount / Mode off{(EMD) has to be deposited and all
Payment participating bidder shall submit "Bid

Security Declaration".

TENDER CALL NOTICE

No.CAD-4015: Sealed tenders are inviting from reputed Firms/
Agency/ Organisation for procurement of different works like
Tantage and Allied works, Still Photography & Videography
and Printing works towards organisation of Zilla Mahotsav
“Kallola-2023 & Pallishree Mela to be held on 15th to 21st Jan,
2023 at Nabakrushna Choudhury Stadium, Jagatsinghpur.
The tender paper alongwith the details specification
Documents Online|19.12.2022 upto 17.00 Hours. and eligibility criteria of the above works will be available
Bidding. in the office of ORMAS, Jagatsinghpur, Clo- ZP,
(ii).Date, time  &{On 21.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the|| | Jagatsinghpur from 3rd to 13th Dec, 2022 by 12.30 PM
venue of Bid Opening[O/o the Superintending Engineer, | | | or tender paper can be downloaded from www.ormas.org.
(Online) E:rr;gaak‘; an';ef;r(thzi”'; ;ﬁ‘i';z‘) Division,| [ | The sealed tenders will be opened in the Office Chamber
(iv) Date, tme & venue|On 57159092 at 1100 Hours i the| | |of CPO-cum-EO, ZP, Jagatsinghpur on the same date
of transparent lottery|O/o the Superintending Engineer, (Date:_13.12.22) at 5.00 PM in t‘he presence of the Bidders
for finalization of bids, if{Rengali  Left Bank Canal Division,| | [oF their authorised representative.
required Kamakhyanagar. The undersigned reserves the right to accept or
reject any or all the tenders without assigning any reason

thereof.
Sd./- Collector & DM
Jagatsinghpur
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8 |Other details:
(i) Procurement Officer

Superintending Engineer, Rengali Left
Bank Canal Division, Kamakhyanagar.
(iiy  Availability of Bid}07.12.2022 from 10.00 Hours to

“Further details can be seen from the Government of Odisha
website https://tendersodisha.gov.in.
Sd./- Superintending Engineer
R.L.B. Canal Division
Kamakhyanagar
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= Procurement Bid Availability of Tender Last date & Date & Time of
Tf?fl W AL 6L | GQWQ% Ql@&G@l @QGQQQ@ A g@g‘ §@|€@ GQQIQ%; %)@ Officer Identification online for bidding time of seek- opening of tender
ddm Q@G‘Iﬁh@ AOILIREQIEER gl WSt LIl dIm 2LOIMER Q@ KR)Em | No. From To ilng;?n?er Tecggica' Fing%da*
~ P i i
60IRA QACCIgREa A9E 9% QIR 9! QIR ARRI0LI Juegl WY 6AANRF ] 5 3 7 caEen 3 7
Q) an - = Chief Construction | CCERWCSBD- | 09.12.2022 |29.12.2022 | 28.12.2022 |30.12.2022| To be
§90 @el0a3 AleR Wl 6@61(2] QlQ@@* QA i \.._ > "_ @“QGQQQ@' QIQIQQ aoldiog| Engineer, Rural Works Online- at upto upto 2.00 PM at intimated
PR PIRR, IV TN QBRI 2R GRIRLAER TS ) SRadin cleInIGIE Circle, Sunabeda 34/2022-23 | 11.00AM. | 5.30 PM 11.00 AM | separately
219! 2SR qo(mé@ QR ("T]C'), ‘Q1 ans EIIQ Ql@@ Q86 ‘-...;..______.‘. gq@ aq@%ﬂ QS‘QIQQGQ 5. The details of works can be seen from the website https://www.tendersodisha.gov.in.
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OFFICE OF THE
COLLECTOR & DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, KHORDHA

(SOCIAL SECURITY SECTION)
Notice No. 6373/Dated. 02.12.2022

Notice

No. gg-22:- Applications are invited in prescribed format
from intending and eligible NGOs 1o run a 30 bedded Drug
De-addiction Centre and Physiotherapy Unit at Integrated|
Infrastructure  Complex, Khudupur, Jatni under Khordha
district. The last date for receipt of application is 15.12.2022 by
5.00 P.M. The details of the applications along with Guideline
for setting up of 30 Bedded Drug De-addiction Centre and
Physiotherapy Unit may be downloaded from the website
www.khordha.nic.in

By Order of Collector,
Sd./- Collector & District Magistrate, Khordha
OIPR-46001/11/0030/2223

No.0-1381:
1. Name of the Work: Construction

k@ OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS CIRCLE, SUNABEDA

e-Procurement Notice for bridge works

2. Class of Contractor: “A” & Special Class of (Odisha PWD) or relevant class of other licensing authority.
3. Estimated Cost: Varies from Rs.395.04 lakhs to Rs.790.61 Lakhs (Approximately)

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA

E-mail: serwsbd2003@yahoo com

of bridges as per Annexure (2 Nos)

6. Any Corrigendum/Addendum wil
OIPR-25182/11/0042/2223

| be displayed in the above e-tender website.
Sd./- Chief Construction Engineer, Rural Works Circle, Sunabeda

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
RENGALI LEFT BANK CANAL DIVISION, AT/P.O. Kamakhyanagar
Dist: Dhenkanal, Odisha, PIN-759018 Ph:06769-270771
No.A-819: Email ID - eerlbcdivision@gmail.com

e-PROCUREMENT NOTICE No. RLBCD-P.-03/2022-23

&3%

"Civil Construction Works".

05 (Five) Nos.

Varies from Rs.13.40 Lakhs to Rs.5.73
Lakhs

Period of Completion |30 Days to 45 Days

Class of Contractor "D" & "C" or equivalent grade/class

Cost of Bid Document /{Varies Rs. 6.000/- to Rs.4,000/-
Mode of Payment (Non-Refundable) / Online through
Electronic Payment Mode (Internet
Banking/ NEFT/RTGS of Designated
Banks and their Aggregator Banks).

7 {EMD / Bid Security{No Bid Security/ Earnest Money Deposit
Amount / Mode off{(EMD) has to be deposited and all
Payment participating bidder shall submit "Bid
Security Declaration".

1 |Category of Work
2 |[Total No. of Works
3 |Estimated Cost

DO

8 |Other details:
(i) Procurement Officer

Superintending Engineer, Rengali Left
Bank Canal Division, Kamakhyanagar.
Availability of Bid}07.12.2022 from 10.00 Hours to
Online[19.12.2022 upto 17.00 Hours.

(i)
Documents
Bidding.
(iii).Date, time &iOn 21.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
venue of Bid Opening|O/o the Superintending Engineer,
(Online) Rengali Left  Bank Canal Division,
Kamakhyanagar(through online).

(iv) Date, time & venue{On 27.12.2022 at 11.00 Hours in the
of transparent lottery{O/o the Superintending Engineer,
for finalization of bids, iffRengali Left Bank Canal Division,
required Kamakhyanagar.

“Further details can be seen from the Government of Odisha
website https://tendersodisha.gov.in.
Sd./- Superintending Engineer
R.L.B. Canal Division
Kamakhyanagar

OIPR-32298/11/0003/2223

File No.ZP-28011/3/2022-ORMAS SEC-ZP-ZILLA PARISHAD
‘ ORMAS

(Odisha Rural Development and Marketing Society)
Panchayati Raj and Drinking Water Department

Tel:06724-231752, Fax:06724-231752 (URL:www.ormas.org),

E-mail:dsmsjagatsinghpur@gmail.com

ORMAS, JAGATSINGHPUR

A District unit of ORMAS
Office of the Zilla Parishad,
Jagatsinghpur,Sanra, Nalibar-754104

Order No.282/ Date:03.12.2022

TENDER CALL NOTICE

No.CAD-4015: Sealed tenders are inviting from reputed Firms/
Agency/ Organisation for procurement of different works like
Tantage and Allied works, Still Photography & Videography
and Printing works towards organisation of Zilla Mahotsav
“Kallola-2023 & Pallishree Mela to be held on 15th to 21st Jan,
2023 at Nabakrushna Choudhury Stadium, Jagatsinghpur.

The tender paper alongwith the details specification
and eligibility criteria of the above works will be available
in the office of ORMAS, Jagatsinghpur, Clo- ZP,
Jagatsinghpur from 3rd to 13th Dec, 2022 by 12.30 PM
or tender paper can be downloaded from www.ormas.org.
The sealed tenders will be opened in the Office Chamber
of CDO-cum-EO, ZP, Jagatsinghpur on the same date
(Date:13.12.22) at 5.00 PM in the presence of the Bidders
or their authorised representative.

The undersigned reserves the right to accept or
reject any or all the tenders without assigning any reason

thereof.
Sd./- Collector & DM
Jagatsinghpur

A
e/

OIPR-19004/11/0008/2223
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- ODISHA HYDRO POWER CORPORATION LTD.
OFFICE OF THE SENIOR GENERAL MANAGER
(ELECTRICAL) UPPER KOLAB HYDRO ELECTRIC PROJECT

AT/P.0.- BARINIPUT, DIST.- KORAPUT - 764006, ODISHA, Phone: (06854)242001, Fax: (06854)242038
e-mail: sgmel.ukhep@ohpcltd.com, CIN: U401010R19955GC003963

TENDER CALL NOTICE No.- UKHEP-41/2022-23 Dated:02.12.2022
No. CAD-4011: Sealed tenders in duplicate are invited from Govt. registered
Agencies/Electrical Contractors having HT Electrical Licence issued by ELBO for
the job as mentioned below by Semiskilled and skilled Workmen on Job contract
basis for a Calendra year (12 Months)

EMD in shape
St Description of Work Cost of Tender of Bid Security
No paper in Rs.
Declaration
Annual Maintenance of 11KV Lines, 11/0.4 KV
Substation, LT Lines, 05 Nos. of distribution Bid Security

Declaration form
duly filled & signed
should be submitted

Transformers, Hlumination System of Street Light, | 708/- inclusive
Internal and External electrication work of Residential of GST
and Non Residential Buildings under UKHEP, Bariniput
for one year on job contract basis.
The sale of tender paper will be from 1 09.12.2022 to 11.00 hrs. of 20.12.2022
The Last date & time of receipt of tender : 12.00 hrs. of 20.12.2022
The date & Time of opening of tender : 12.30 hrs. of 20.12.2022
For details of tender documents, terms & conditions, eligibility criteria and
downloading, please refer our website www.ohpcltd.com.

$d./- C & P Head
Upper Kolab H.E. Project, Bariniput

OIPR-04002/11/0070/2223
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ODISHA PUBLIC SERVIGE GOMMISSION, CUTTAGK

NOTICE

No. 10934/PSC
PF-1E-11-2021/22 (DR-HI1)
No. D-239: It is for information of all concerned that, 12 (Twelve) candidates bearing following PPSAN/
Reference Nos. have been called for the physical verification of original Certificates/Documents to
determine their eligibility and suitability for recruitment to the Post of Post Graduate Teacher in
Telugu for 17 Nos. of stand-alone Government Higher Secondary Schools, pursuant to Advt. No. 24
of 2021-22.

Dt.06.12.2022

PROGRAMME OF DOCUMENT VERIFICATION

Date Time PPSAN/Reference Nos. of Candidates
00117959, 00115368, 00119623, 00118776, 00119762, 00133222,
12.12.2022 | 02.30 P.M. 00114162, 00116108, 00123922, 00121652, 00121574 & 00120085
=12 Candidates

The candidates are required to bring one set of self-attested photocopies of all the documents along

with all original documents for verification as mentioned below:

Hard copy of the online application form.

Three recent passport size photographs.

Duly filled in and attested “Attestation Form” and duly filled in Bio-data Form” (to be downloaded

from the website of the Commission) '

H.S.C. or equivalent certificate in support of declaration of age issued by the concerned Board/

Council.

Post-Graduation Certificate/Master's Degree in the subject concerned in respect of educational

qualification prescribed.

Mark-sheets in support of all the Examinations (HSC, Intermediate/+2, Graduation/+3, Post

Graduation & B.Ed.) including fail marks, if any, issued by the concerned Board/Council/University.

Degree or Diploma Certificate in Computer Application in respect of educational qualification

prescribed;

Odia Test Pass Certificate.

Caste Certificate claim as S.T./S.C./S.E.B.C. wherever applicable.

10 Permanent Disability Certificate (including percentage of permanent disability i.e. 40% and more).

11. Ex-Servicemen are required to attach copy of Discharge Certificate issued by the Commanding
Officer of the unit last served. They must submit an affidavit undertaking that he/she has not been
appointed against any civil post after retirement from military service, wherever applicable.

12 Sports Persons Certificate issued by the Director of Sports Odisha.

13. Any proof of Identity.

Note: It is also made clear that the candidature of these candidates for the recruitment is purely] -

provisional. The candidature is liable for rejection in the event of inadequacy/deficiency found at any

stage during or after the selection process and is subject to fulfillment of the terms and conditions laid

down in the advertisement. Mere participation in the document verification does not reserve any right

for selection.

OIPR-12002/11/0214/2223

o N o a0 ~ b=

Sd./- Additional Secretary

GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA
“@” PROCUREMENT NOTICE

Bid Identification No. 32 of 2022-23

No. 0-1369: The Superintending Engineer, RWS&S Division,
Balangir on behalf of Governor of Odisha invites percentage bid
through e-procurement in double cover system according to norm of
e-procurement system in online mode for the different work in different
blocks under Balangir District.
1. Nature of Work . Construction of ESR, UGR, pump

house with laying of rising main

and distribution in different villages

of Balangir district.

2. Total No. of Work 1 07 Nos.
3. Estimated Cost : Rs.346.71 to 470.54 lakh
4. Eligible Class of Contractor  : "A” Contractor
5. Period of Completion . Eighteen Months
6. Other Details :
Procurement Bld ] Availability of'Tel'nder Online for
Officer Identification Bidding
No. From To
Superintending
Engineer, RWSS |32 of 2022 - 23 Dt.15.12.2022 Dt.30.12.2022
2 ; at 11.00 hrs. upto 17.00 hrs.
Division, Balangir

Further details can be had in the DTCN available in the website www.

tendersodisha.gov.in. Sd./- Superintending Engineer

RWS&S Division, Balangir
OIPR-25033/11/0031/2223
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ODISHA PUBLIC SERVIGE GOMMISSION, CUTTAGK

NOTICE

No. 10938/PSC
PF-1E-11-2021/22 (DR-I)
No. D-238: It is for information of all concerned that, 12 (Twelve) candidates bearing following PPSAN/
Reference Nos. have been called for the physical verification of original Certificates/Documents to
determine their eligibility and suitability for recruitment to the Post of Post Graduate Teacher in
Indian Music for 17 Nos. of stand-alone Government Higher Secondary Schools, pursuant to Advt.
No. 24 of 2021-22.

Dt.06.12.2022

PROGRAMME OF DOCUMENT VERIFICATION

Date Time PPSAN/Reference Nos. of Candidates
00115936, 00033373, 00087545, 00125469, 00114013, 00121927,
12.12.2022 | 10.30 A.M. {00125796, 00114469, 00114353, 00132847, 00131519 & 00117885
=12 Candidates

The candidates are required to bring one set of self-attested photocopies of all the documents along

with all original documents for verification as mentioned below:

Hard copy of the online application form.

Three recent passport size photographs.

Duly filled in and attested “Attestation Form” and duly filled in Bio-data Form” (to be downioaded

from the website of the Commission)

H.S.C. or equivalent certificate in support of declaration of age issued by the concerned Board/

Council.

Post-Graduation Certificate/Master's Degree in the subject concerned in respect of educational

qualification prescribed.

Mark-sheets in support of all the Examinations (HSC, Intermediate/+2, Graduation/+3, Post

Graduation & B.Ed.) including fail marks, if any, issued by the concerned Board/Council/University.

Degree or Diploma Certificate in Computer Application in respect of educational qualification

prescribed;

QOdia Test Pass Certificate.

Caste Certificate claim as S.T./S.C./S.E.B.C. wherever applicable.

10 Permanent Disability Certificate (including percentage of permanent disability i.e. 40% and more).

11. Ex-Servicemen are required to attach copy of Discharge Certificate issued by the Commanding
Officer of the unit last served. They must submit an affidavit undertaking that he/she has not been
appointed against any civil post after retirement from military service, wherever applicable.

12 Sports Persons Certificate issued by the Director of Sports Odisha.

13. Any proof of Identity.

Note: It is also made clear that the candidature of these candidates for the recruitment is purely

provisional. The candidature is liable for rejection in the event of inadequacy/deficiency found at any

stage during or after the selection process and is subject to fulfillment of the terms and conditions laid

down in the advertisement. Mere participation in the document verification does not reserve any right

for selection.

OIPR-12002/11/0217/2223

o N o 0~ b=

Sd./- Additional Secretary

FA.Q. 2100 {i8e 694 994 QI igy aiel Qe4Ie geana el
°. QIR AI1B, 64IIR, T2Q QI p AYE 6ERe agId % ébcc (3@@ | qu 3 @ﬁlg @Qﬂ @8 No. CAD-4009
9. g5, 10, 214, 2B QI 6UINI AGYID 6TRR QY aRid % T—— : (6561 FaRNEE 6l SBI LG 16 REIE)
9. S, 6QQET, AGIR Gl 6N ASUT 8% ;
(HQ1Q, VAR NL° 6AIN| IORG| ¥ FRIER 99]) nnlsnn BI““GE & en“srn“chn" conponnlrlou lIMITEn
¥ 21@@0;2 981& age, sl QI QG;,’@.@ Qoud 0% No. 8551 (A Government of Odisha Undertaking under Works Department) b 03422022
. » r > o o 0. ate: i V5
3. 6g@ 1 AQuIRGe ARSI CAIS IS AAAIE 9% File: SMT-1838 NOTICE INVITING TENDER
. . Development of Shree Gundicha Temple, Puri and
9. Al 9% 1 {Name of work : | Development of Pleasure Garden (Pramod Udyan) of the
8.Q.: °. RN QT AFR AT UBIQS IV 9U 62 AR | Lord, Puri under ABADHA Scheme on Turnkey Basis

ARG .00 QTRIOIQ 2L 9.00 QTR FIEQ 6G1RR
AIRAQ! SIFIFIER @ 6019R6a 996 Iagea F.A.Q. qIea
AR G4 625 AEER|

9. 6 66N41T GBI Tl HIGY EATIE G NNQT SRUIS SRS
P37 QRILS! FAQ €099 HAR AFIQE AIFIBR FAQ
G 6LISIELNS REIRER |

QRA-GRIAIR Sl AN
2. 9e.4., edle

SRR G2 AN
fw go @68, edle

Bid Identification No. . 152/Tender/OBCC/2022-23

Date of availability of bid document in e-procurement

- 1From 09.12.2022
portal

Last date & time of receipt of Online bid . |Upto 5.00 P.M. on 04.01.2023

Last Date of Pre-Bid Queries .1 Tilt 5.00 PM. on 16.12.2022

1At 11.30 AM. on 17.12.2022 (Through Video

Date & time for pre-bid mesting " | Conferencing) https://meet.google.com/nzo-ngdg-zoq

Date of issuance of Pre-bid Clarification . 120.12.2022

@~ O |(gyd W N

Date of Bid Opening :104.01.2023 at 05.30 PM.

09. Further details can be seen from the e-Procurement portal https:/fwww.tendersodisha.gov.in.
10. OBCC has the right to accept or reject the Notice/RFP without assigning any reason thereof.

OIPR-34161/11/0027/2223 Sd./- EIC-cum-Managing Director
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R caeRn anal AN OINHM  yyalkein-Interview  Owec222l | EOREST ENVIRONMENT & CLIMATE CHANGE DEPARTMENT
Q@QI G?Iqu@ﬂ &ml | No.E-699:- Walk-in-interview will be conducted in the office of the undersigned for engagement in the following post under NHM, ’
@O e - Mayurbhanj with monthly remuneration as noted below as per the norms & conditions under ZSS, Mayurbhanj. No. FE_D|V_FLD_0016_2022_17964[FE&CC, Bhubaneswar, dated the 07.10.22
6 G?Qi %Ig@@ﬂ QQQ z l;:)ss:g :&e r::;. Place of Posting Ren()itrl'nRe:'l)tion Eligibility Criteria & Preference vl;)::le; Zifrr‘;:aﬁ(_ 10F (COI’]S) 09/2022
AN 2 _ i? 01.11.2022) _|Post » , , __ in-Interview ORDER
&el 6@%{?1@1 Qo e Pasdiatrician . Ba;:;‘ir%ﬁ-rag'lon ?fgﬁii%'ihre“f?gJﬁlezaef‘ﬁsgiﬁsvefé"g Sub: Diversion of 4.31 ha of Revenue forest land Memo No. 17967/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22
QQI“:’L @Ol 49 %mgl | Upto 70 years) | O | DEIC: Baripada | - et 235 :\gg‘ljsltcr:\itlocr?l;?ocr:r: e St ounci of (3.358 ha of Jhanajhana Mouza & 0.952 ha Copy along with the copy of annexures forwarded
@ A IR ARYES __remunerstion _|Medical Regitaton. gf ?(hgnka I'VloutZ_a) fOff lelepafatlo? F?ft land {5 the Principal Chief Conservator of Forests (Wildlife)
oR afenl  woae Medical Offi UPHC, Resostirl |vees o sed b ank for relocation or villagers of Flanau, g cChief Wildlife Warden, Odisha/ Principal Chief
. 4 Qlce 8cicq ||2| Contactiay | o4 | RGNS | i 25% ecical Counci of i & wi vald Ratanmara & Jhunaposi Hamlets situated conservator of Forests (FD & NO) FC Act, Olo PCCF
@I@&JQI %1?@@@@1@@91@ B ormanate rg;t::et::f'zn oo j!3filgdei(g;dnag:frhKv:gg;E:rs?Vr\‘l?ltdul?fg uSic\‘l?;if)hne & HoFF, Odisha for information and necessary action.
. Rs.1500/- . C es R ’ - - - i
Rl SR @8 conaeal | Secialistoag | UPHG cossion (Maxmmum IMBBS and PG in 0 & G and vaid Anandapur, Keonjhar District, Odisha. 8d./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government
(U(pt:r70';1eea)rs) Tulasichoura two session per  |registration from OCMR. WHEREAS, Tahasildar, Hatadihi Tahasn, At/ Memo No. 17968/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22
Qe ~ §20a%a Specialist in Rs_.1238~ per ) o 13.12.2002 at (I?I(\)/-e};'isalt)a:lr(])'% 4Dés1t'ﬁzorgpaéévggfg‘afo:‘ea;tj lgggh?g 3?£ Copy along with the cqpy of an.nexures forwarded
RSl UTI LEFIR 4 Paed|at_ncs 01 UF_’HC session (Maximum MB_BS and l_:’G in Paediatrics and 11 AM in NHM ) . . to the FD, S_TR-cum_—ReglonaI_ C_)h|ef COT'ISGI"VGtOII" of
@C@@IQIQ Gmlf@ e (Part Time) Tulasichoura two session per |valid registration from OCMR. Conference Hall ha of Jhanjhan Mouza & 0.952 ha of Dhenka Mauza) Forests, Baripada Circle/ Divisional Forest Officer,
= < P estai, RS0 for preparation of land bank for relocation of villagers Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandapur for information
E“fl’ OB usla 69624, 5| Medicine | UPHC session (Maximum |MBBS and PG in Medicine and valid of Pitanau, Ratnamara & Jhunaposi Hamlets situated and immediate necessary compliance.
Q3 ﬂﬂ']@pé’] QQKM@, (Part Time) Tulasichoura two session per | registration from OCMR. inside Hadagarh Wildlife Sanctua’-y underthejurisdiction X .
gel Qe ad@ee (Upto 70 years) UPHE day) of Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandpur of Keonjhar ¢ '_I'hhe Applll_cant ?gtehncy m(?%/_ als? bfe |n?tr:Jcted to
Psychiatric Debentiapur Rs.1500/- per ' District. Odisha. urnish compliance to the conditions for forest clearance
o0 Q@ Specialist b | session (Maximum |MBBS with post graduate Degree or ’ pertaining to the project in every quarter to the Divisional
TR QY LI YS! 6 ? 04 | Murgabadi, . i ' . . ; > = N
~ (Part Time) Tulasichoura & | O session per | Diploma in psychiatry And whereas, the Govt. of India, MoEF&CC, Forest Officer, Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandapur
Qe  geml e (Upto 70 years) Rairangpur day) Integrated Regional Office, Bhubaneswar vide their for facilitating 'monitojring (gf complgances by’them P
doea  QIdkl 96Q 1Rl - UPHC Rs.500/- Th hould have B.Sc (H letter No0.5-ORB506/2022-BHU  dtd.23.09.2022 in s ' . s
© @ . N:t:;t!rqmst o D'abendgazgr, I (Mafgum Sc;zgce;?;’gzsflgradi‘fﬁon ° (ng consideration of the relovant proposal of the State - The Divisional forest Officer, Keonjhar (Wildlife)
m'g%“ﬂ SRS (Part Time) urgabadi, two session per | Science/ Nutrition in from recognized . . Division, Anandapur is also instructed to ensure that
~ ~ (Upto 70 years) Tulasichoura & e Government furnished vide letter No0.4427/FE&CC . ) ) : ;
. day) institutions h
ATAQT cSlmeem | Rairangpur . . the direction given to the applicant agency is executed
] ~ ! Bachelor Degres i~ Gocupational dtd. 03.03.2022 have communicated their approval for immediatel ,
6LAler AgUge 2l Il Therapy (B.O.T) from a recognized diversion of 4.31 ha of Revenue forest land (3.358 ha Y- .
=~ Occunational Rs30,012P |institution/University. The Degree| 15 5005 ot of Jhanajhana Mouja & 0.952 ha of Dhenka Mouza) Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government
64 GG‘]QQ 9‘2161’ @ QO P maximum 25%  jmust be 4 ¥ years of full time course : H H
~ 8| Therapist | 01 | DEIC Baripada | K T e e, of computsory 1AM at NHM for preparation of land bank for relocaiton of villagers Memo No. 17969/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22
L6V Ql{@’\ QMGG‘“ (Upto 40 years) remuneration internship. Exvpverience: The candidate Conference Hall of Pitanau, Ratanmara & Jhunaposi Hamlets situated Copy along with the copy of annexures forwarded
a1 QI TRl 696w g‘:;fﬁ’;;;’;n”!;:::;:?‘efpyef;f:cgfP°S‘ inside Hadagarh Wildlife Sanctuary under the jurisdiction 1 sT & scC Development Department/ Revenue &

6RCNIE 8RR GRS
Q6AQ @F Joresa

QYIe QRN
JIFJROY IRER

9109
QAR 9IGINEP

€AY, 81€9(8.9.)
GOEIE Tl YTIR G
AR NI(ENR)Q P
2RLIAT QR AN KR
AT AR AIPIA

= = : : be are authorized to allow for use of the forest communicated by the MoEF, Government of India vide
Naee e o6l Date Time PPSAN Nos. of Candidates case may be : . .

G 9 oo dR 00093578, 00120447, 00090691, 00122422, 00089820, 00117945, |land in question for the purpose of preparation of land their letter F. No.7-23/2012-FC dtd.24.07.2013.
ROl Gefordin G 10.30 A.M. |00092314, 00101252, 00116384, 00091662, 00100117, 00096242, | |bank for relocation of villagers of Pitanau, Ratanmara . They shall publish the entire forest clearance
oM TRAY 68D | s 1n o000 00103998, 00119265 & 00117302 = 15 Candidates & Jhunaposi Hamlets situated inside Hadagarh Wildlife granted in verbatim along with conditions and
Ieey Soekm | %Q@ga e 00118990, 00100779, 00124720, 00096884, 00102909, 00116380,|| | Sanctuary under the jurisdiction of Keonjhar (Wildlife) safeguards imposed by the Central Government

= - 02.30 PM. [00103552, 00092017, 00048661, 00101684, 00040565, 00101333, || | Division, Anandapur, Keonjhar District, Odisha subject in their approval order for forest clearance in
6dind N QEiERe 00115159, 00101361 & 00126033 = 15 Candidates to fulfilment of the conditions as laid down in the two widely circulated daily newspapers, one in
AIml @dQ 4wl QO 00112561, 00058717, 00123129, 00111966, 00114657, 00060517, approval order and compliance of Court's order if any, vernacular language and the other in English
U} en 08  aean 10.30 A.M. [00104735, 00018802, 00099935, 00126097, 00132373, 00098890, following due procedure of law. language so as to make people aware of the
ceal Q0 aalg coe | 14122022 00117918, 00104445 & 00091547 = 15 Candidates The Divisional Forest Officer, Keonjhar (Wildlife) permission granted to the Project for use of
2 a 02.30 PM. (00089840, 00061975, 00118251, 00128655, 00089143, 00104826, | | L ViSion, Anandapur is aiso directed to monitor  forestfand for rion forest purposes.

GBI 2L @M | : ML : , ' Y i : : compliance to the conditions stipulated for such ii. They shall submit the copies of forest
6d B QAN AR 00092343, 00034707 & 00103224 = 15 Candidates diversion in the respective forest clearance order and clearance orders granted by the Central
> 00117256, 00050541, 00086525, 00098588, 00100640, 00099115 | |1’ resort violations, if any, to the Nodal Officer, O/o the Governiment/State Govermmerrs to the Heads

FARANAG FLIST FIMER 10.30 A M. |00116890, 00122537, 00100547, 00115506, 00121834, 00117741 - ; - o
oaeeEnl Gea R 00035161, 00099427 & 00102995 = 15 Candidates | |PCCF & HoFF, Odisha and to the Forest, Environment of local bodies, Panchayats and Municipal
QeER o1l QIR0 @ ean 15122022 00114688, 00119101, 00118203, 00063105, 00041139, 00073447, |& Climate Change Department. bl;)dles in addition ’tro the reIe|;,ant ofﬁc.eslof
e ¢ 9 02.30 PM. |00078795, 00115121, 00027017, 00066781, 00102512, 00103668, By order of Governor the Government, who in turn, has to display

agY 9RQ SuIsR AR 00094959, 00020850 & 00117024 = 15 Candidates 8d./- (Lingaraj Otta) the same for 30 days from date of receipt.
99 AY Sl YR GoLkR | 00111827, 00103554, 00101158, 00103206, 00114485, 00072310, OSD-cum-Special ~ Secretary to  jji. Detailed action taken in compliance to the

060, B GRPIIG. T 10.30 A.M. {00102756, 00122662, 00080073, 00031839, 00121478, 00122096,|| |Government above order of State Government shall be
s aone o oeom | 1012202 e sz | | No. 17965 EBCC, Date-07.10.22 il R R oML 0L

, , , , , , . ivision, nandapur/FD, -cum- >
2o Thelg  6eEeR 02.30 PM. 00056800, 00103290, 00028544, 00127790, 00068340, 00056511 | |, tr?:%ir?::?ggl ‘g'rt]?eEhgo‘r:g?r’vgzo'?“Or}eégﬁgztgogwggdffg Baripada Circle/ PCCF & HoFF, Odishal
y & 00034146 = 13 Candidates : FE&CC Department for reference.

64 QQIg 609 R
FoeEm |9 60R TRl 6P

otiiiiea GSHQQIQ 2. Three recent passport size photographs. Officer, Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandapur and the ’c(leara.’l:ce orf,’s;'.fto g?e. inisignal ;oreSt. Officer,
@ GQQQIel AHWAIEQ 3. Duly filed in and attested “Attestation Form” and duly filled in “Bio-data Form” (to be| |applicant agency may be imparted for required follow €97 a; (MZ ife) 'ws'fon’ nan ar;)urhl_n every
Pl 60983 g@@g@ downloaded from the website of the Commission) ) up action at their end. The applicant agency may also quarter, for epurpos? of monitoring by him.

~ 4. H.8.C. or equivalent certificate in support of declaration of age issued by the concerned| |phe instructed to furnish compliance to the conditions Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government
Ngd AA6asl gl agl| Board/Council.

St = se o)
ARl MIEER  AUFYRR
RS AT 2Em | QLM
J6Q WG 6HROIG QR

= " University. enclosures in the website of Forest & Environment
GIOERE M @SSR B  |8. Degree or Diploma Certificate in Computer Application in respect of educational qualification Memo No. 17966/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22 Department immediately for infomation of all concerned.
prescribed; Copy along with the copy of annexures forwarded to the This is required in compliace to order of Hon’ble

AT 635679Q YR
AMRq oI Teml|
AR 6RPe TN I

S more). Director General of Forests (Central), MoEF&CC
‘5“@@ & ﬁggg@ef? 12.Ex-Servicemen are required to attach copy of Discharge Certificate issued by thel |government of India. IRO A/g Chagdrasekharpur’ Memo No. 17973/FE&CC,Date- 07.10.22
godlga  edind - Gle’ ﬁ)o/mrr]nar?ding Officer of the unit last served. T.h.e‘y m“s‘tff“bmi? an afﬁdfa"it “”?,ertaking that] | Bhubaneswar for kind information and necessary follow _ COPY with copy of Annexures forwarded to the Under
A ING ST @oR! Wi:reevef:p%?itczg.een appointed against any civil post after refirement from miltary service. | | 5 action in compliance to the order of the Hor'ble NGT gecre;[agr‘yéo Govemmterl‘Dt, Of?tce Estt?bllghfmentfectlond
P ) ) ) i i ores nvironment Department for information an

6AFIER 6a6m @en |13 Sports Persons Certificate issued by the Director of Sports Odisha. dtd.07.11.2012 in Appeal No.07/2012 communicated by . . X

T (i 14.A2y oroof of Identty. y P the MOEF, Govt. of India vide their F.No.7-23/2012-C necessary action with reference to their letter No.
SIRERUN GG‘IQQS(GI]Q) Note: It is also made clear that the candidature of these candidates for the recruitment is purely| [dtd.24.07.2013. 129%%/7&gsdéd' 16.087.201'6I. s tarv to G ¢
B QG IR  GIAUQ  |provisional. The candidature is liable for rejection in the event of inadequacy/deficiency found Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government " -cum-sSpecial secretary to sovernmen
?Jm(QC‘) [ AR at any stage during or after the selection process and is subject to fulfiliment of the terms and OIPR-24330/11/0002/2223

- S conditions laid down in the advertisement. Mere participation in the document verification does

601992 G Zlumsy QEfodiM  not reserve any right for selection.

60U €I SINIE FoR |

OIPR-10020/11/0014/2223

The participants are required to arrive in the venue for registration by 10.30 A.M. The eligible candidates should come prepared
for Walk-in-interview with the filled in Application form, 2 passport size photographs, original certificates for verification & self
attested photocopes of all the certificates & proof of age. The Terms & conditions, application form can be downloaded from
the website www.mayurbhanj.nic.in. The undersigned reserves the right to cance! the advertisement without assigning any
reason thereof.

Sd./- (Dr. Rupabhanu Mishra)
Chief District Medical & PHO, Mayurbhanj

NOTICE

No.10950/PSC
PF-1E-11-2021/22 (DR-Ill)

Dt.05.12.2022

PROGRAMME OF DOCUMENT VERIFICATION

) ODISHA PUBLIG SERVICE GOMMISSION, GUTTACK

No. D-240: It is for information of all concerned that, 118 (One hundred Eighteen) candidates
bearing following PPSAN Nos. have been called for the physical verification of original Certificates/
Documents to determine their eligibility and suitability for recruitment to the Post of Post Graduate
Teacher in PHYSICS for 17 Nos. of stand-alone Government Higher Secondary Schools, pursuant
to Advt. No. 24 of 2021-22. The document verification shall be held in office of the Commission at
19, DR. P.K. Parija Road, Cuttack as per the following programme detailed below:

1.

9

Hard copy of the online application form.

The candidates are required to bring one set of self-attested photocopies of all the documents
along with all original documents for verification as mentioned below:

Post-Graduation Certificate/Master’'s Degree in the subject concerned in respect of
educational qualification prescribed.

B.Ed. Certificate.

Mark-sheets in support of all the Examinations (HSC, Intermediate/+2, Graduation/+3, Post
Graduation & B.Ed.) including fail marks, if any, issued by the concerned Board/Council/

Odia Test Pass Certificate.

OIPR-12002/11/0213/2223

16.Caste Certificate claim as S.T./S.C./S.E.B.C. wherever applicable.
11.Permanent Disability Certificate (including percentage of permanent disability i.e. 40% and

Sd./- Additional Secretary

of Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandapur, Keonjhar
District, Odisha (Annexure-l) subject to fulfillment of
certain conditions as stipulated therein.

Now, therefore, Govt. of Odisha do hereby allows
diversion of 4.31 ha of Revenue forest land (3.358 ha
of Jhanajhana Mouza & 0.952 ha of Dhenka Mouza)
for preparation fo land bank for relocaiton of villagers
of Pitanau, Ratanmara & Jhunaposi Hamlets situated
inside Hadagarh Wildlife Sanctuary under the jurisdiction
of Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Anandapur, Keonjhar
District, Odisha subject to fulfiliment of the conditions
as stipulated by Govt. of india, MoEF & CC, Integrated
Regional Office, Bhubaneswar in their approval letter
referred above. The detailed land schedule of the forest
land as receieved from PCCF & HoFF, Odisha vide his
letter No.3244 dtd.17.02.2022 is appended herewith as
Annexure-ll (One Page).

The Collector, Keonjhar and Divisional Forest
Officer, Keonjhar (Wildlife) Division, Ananadapur, as the

Odisha for kind information and necessary followup
action.

Appropriate instruction to the Divisional Forest

of forest clearance pertaining to the project in every
quarter to the Divisional Forest Officer, Keonjhar
(Wildlife) Division, Anandapur for facilitating monitoring
of compliances.

Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government

Asst. Inspector General of Forests, Government of India,
MoEF&CC (FC Division), Indira Paryavaran Bhawan,
Jor Bagh, Aliganj Road, New Delhi, Pin-110003/ Deputy

Disaster Management Department/ Collector, Keonjhar
for information and necessary follow up action.

Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government
Memo No. 17970/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22

Copy along with the copy of annexures forwarded to
the Private Secretary to Minister of Forest, Environment
& Climate Change for kind information of Hon’ble
Minister.

Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government
Memo No. 17971/FE&CC, Date- 07.10.22

Copy along with the copy of the Annexures forwarded
to the Tahasildar, Hatadihi Tahasil, At/Po-Hatadihi,

Dist.- Keonjhar, Odisha, Pin-758083 for information and
immediate necessary action.

The user agency is asked to take following
actions immediately as per orders of Hon’ble National
Green Tribunal dtd.07.11.2012 in Appeal No0.07/2012

The applicant agency shall furnish compliances
to the conditions prescribed in the forest/wildlife

Memo No. 17972/FE&CC,Date- 07.10.22

Copy with copy of Annexures fowarded to the
Head, State Portal, 1.T. Centre, Odisha Secretariat,
Bhubaneswar for information and necessary action.
He is requested to upload this order along with its

National Green Tribunal dtd.07.11.2012 in Appeal
No.7/2012. Hence this may be done unfailingly.

Sd./- OSD-cum-Special Secretary to Government

See Career Appointment on every Wednesday & Saturday
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Newly open Asribada

@60 99, 9¢, M0 e°
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QAN RAT VIR,
algeq 4BHK®Q
Duplex 499° QQQIQ
dI69Q IR gole 99
sqft.g 1600-Rs. €2

i @ @uQIag| Contact:

”t@’”@bl’g 9439539146,

9777T777525. D-2075

SALE Plot for sale at

. Daspur (Near
Immediate sale BMW

X52014-15  limited| | garsh  School).

edition, AUDI-A6-2012,
AUDI-A4-2012,
BMW-520D-2011
Volkswagan
Passat-2012 for details
contact: 9827516256.

D-74161

Bhubaneswar. 4.5KM
from Kalinga Studio
Square. 9776422211.

D-16379

QICEIQ Q& @R
AR ada 9eq g,
aleeq AN ge G
689 - 9827119799.

D-2132

REAL ESTATE

Luxurious 4BHK
Duplex near Balianta
Bazar. Land-1400
Construction-
2200-79 Lakh.
9938219397,
9861022055.

D-2169

CONSTRUCTION

Construct your home
@850/-, 1340/-
includes architecture
structure with 3year
FMC, provide BDA
plan approval
boring/ interiorwork.
SNV  Construction.
9439295469.

(A )
Y

Healthcare

Panchakarma herbal
SPA Kesarimall,
Bhubaneswar.
Contact

8926173473.

AFFIDAVIT

I, Jagannath Nayak,
alias Jagabandhu
Nayak aged about
(43) S/o- Suka
Nayak, Routaragadia,
Badabarchikayan, Dist-
Bhadrak. | have an
LIC bearing Policy No.
587368949  wherein
my name is Jagannath
Nayak. That in my bank
passbook my name is
Jagabandhu  Nayak.
That | declare that
Jagannath Nayak and
Jagabandhu Nayak
Slo- Suka  Nayak

same and One person.
D-2170

D-74604
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Group Grade Date
A Nursery-UKG  11° Dec. 2022
B Std.1&m 11" Dec. 2022
c Std. M-V 11* Dec. 2022
D Std. VI - VIl 11" Dec. 2022
E Std. IX - XI 11" Dec. 2022

Everyone has a unique talent

JDM INTER DISTRICT COMPETITIONS (Any One)

Item -1 Item -1
ores s
Poem Recitation Impersonation
(Eng. only) {Any Language)
Speech (Eng. only) Postermaking
(Eng. anly) (Tribute o Parents)

Debate
(.o Aptitude Test

A participant can participate in any one of the selected items from each group.
Registration FREE from 20" Nov 2022 to 8" Dec 2022.

Registrations can be done at school or through Online
https://forms.gle/BVMqrfF94hszQaC87 or SCAN the code
Additional information related to the competitions will be intimated through WHATSAPP.
Place ot ch(diutliot- 2
SBD INTERNATIONAL SCHOOL
Affiliated to CBSE (DAY BOARDING)

Y~ 0d Campus : Samaraipur, Beside NH-16, Bhadrak
New Campus : Gopabandhupur, Beside NH-16, Bhadrak

25% of seats reserved in Std. | as per R.T.E. norms

CONTACT
7855080800

7077710014
8249395363
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With Best Compliments From

DHABALESWAR INSTITUTE
OF POLYTECHNIC &
DHABALESWAR INDUSTRIAL
TRAINING CENTRE

“The News The Dharitri” is the land mark in the Annalas of history of News-
paper. It gives the people current information from time to time. Literary
writings in the newspaper are of appex quality than in any other newspaper.

We wish the Newspaper “The Dharitri” to be more glorious and succesful in
the coming days.

CHAIRMAN

Dhabaleswar Institute of Polytechnic & Dhabaleswar Industrial Training

Centre, Radhadamodarpur, Khuntuni, Cuttack
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