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Hero MotoCorp Ltd. Regd. Office: The Grand Plaza, Plot No.2, Nelson Mandela Road, Vasant Kunj Phase - II, New Delhi - 110070, India. | CIN: L35911DL1884PLC017354
| For further information, contact your nearest Hero MotoGorp authorised outlet or visit us on www.HeroMotoCorp.com. Accessories and features shown may not be a
part of standard fitment. Always wear a helmet while riding a two-wheeler. *Finance offer is at the sole discretion of the Financier, subject to its respective T&Cs. Available
at select dealerships. *Offer amount and combination of offer may vary for model/variant and states and it is applicable on select models only. For more details, please
visit your nearest authorised Hero outlet. **Terms and Conditions apply. *Ex-Showroom Price of Hf Deluxe Self Start in Bhubaneswar.

HF Deluxe @ No.1 esoa agaeiq

@ HF DELUXE 6 @I¢' 2iea
P NI 661IQS G

oawsasig <4999

Authorized Dealers: Bargarh: Aakash Hero - 9289922181, Bhawanipatna: Arundhati Hero - 9289922837, Bolangir: Arundhati Hero - 9289923033, Jharsuguda: Vijaylaxmi Hero - 9289922595, Sambalpur:
Sri Shyam Hero - 9289922484, Sonepur: Jai Jawan Hero - 9289922800, Associate Dealers: Deogarh: Jindal Motors - 9437056659, Brajrajnagar: Bina Motors - 9861078290, Belpahar: Varsha Motors -
9437058417, Bamra: Choudhury Motors - 9938274720, Junagarh: Shree Bimala Motors - 9668287479, Rajakhariar: Jagdamba Auto Combines - 9937002262, Boudh: Bansal Auto - 9437062948, Nuapada:
Maruti Auto - 9178014999, Padampur: Debesh Motors - 9437253970, Barpalli: Durga Motors - 9861265979, Titlagarh: Sneha Motors - 9853925879, Jagdalpur: Kiran Sales - 9827654949, Kesinga:
Annapurna Automobile - 7978787287, Rampur: Aruna Automobiles - 8114331356.
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TPW®DL

TP WESTERN ODISHA DISTRIBUTION LIMITED

(A Joint Venture of Tata Power and Government of Odisha)
Corporate Office : Burla, Dist.-Sambalpur (Odisha)-768017

NOTICE INVITING TENDER

TN.TPWODL/MK/O/SER/2500000959 Date. 19.05.2025
TP Western Odisha Distribution Limited, invites tender quotations
(in 2part bidding) from eligible vendors for the following package :
Rate Contract for Meter Installation and
Associated Services for 2 years.

Interested bidders are to submit Tender Participation Fee and
Authorization Letter through email on or before 28" May 2025,
18:00Hrs, after which the link from e-Tender system shall be shared
with them.

For detailed tender documents of the above-mentioned tender, please
visit Tender section of www.tpwesternodisha.com. All details for
participating in the tender is given in the tender document.

All future correspondence regarding the tender, bid submission,
date extension etc. will take place with the participating bidders only

through E-Tender system.
Sd/- Head-Contracts & Procurement

@; OFFICE OF THE MUNICIPAL COUNGIL, KHORDHA

H & UD Department, Govt. of Odisha, Khordha - 752055
e-Mail: khurda_municipality@yahoo.co.in, Phone No.: 06755-220674"
No. 1623 Date: 16.05.25

QUOTATION CALL NOTICE
No. C-347: Sealed quotations are invited in Double Cover (Form A: Technical Bid,
Form B: Financial Bid) from reputed registered Transport Agency/Goods Carrier
Business Holders/Private Agency & Individual for “Providing 10 Nos. Light
Commercial Vehicle (LCV) including Driver for Collection of Dry Waste & Wet
Waste separately in special Bins from Door to Door of 22 Nos. Ward of Khordha
Municipality” for the Sanitation work i.e. lifting of garbages in separately method
i.e. dry & wet wastage in special bins on monthly rent basis. All quotation should be
accompanied with PAN and GST Registration Certificate etc. Tender paper can be
obtained from Cashier section of Khordha Municipality in payment of Rs.2000.00
(Rupees two thousand only) (Non-refundable). Bidder should be submitted EMD of]|
Rs.5000/- (Rupees five thousand only) (Refundable) in shape of BD/BC in favour of
Executive Officer, Khordha Municipality payable at Khordha. The application form of
quotation/tender containing general bid information and other terms & condition witl be
available in www.khordha.nic.in (District Portal) and www.khordhamunicipality.in
{Office Portal). The guotationer should quote their rate of the price both in figure and
words. All quotations will be recieved in specific quotation box kept in the Office of
the undersigned from Date: 19.05.25 at 10.30 A.M. upto Date: 06.06.25 at 10.30
A.M. except Sunday & Holidays and wili be opened on Date: 10.06.25 at 11.00 A.M.
in presence of quotationer or their authorized representatives in the Chamber of
Executive Officer, Khordha Municipality. No conditional or incomplete quotation will
be accepted. The financial bid will be opened only technical bid qualifier evaluated
by Tender Committee.
Supply order will be given to the successful guotationer with an agreement of|
undersigned.
The authority shall have the right to accept or reject all the quotations without
assigning any reason thereof.

Sd./- Executive Officer, Khordha Municipality
OIPR-13082/11/0017/2526
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#¥ DISTRICT PROJECT OFFICE
+%) SAMAGRA SHIKSHA, SUNDARGARH, ODISHA §

In front of B.S. High School, At/P.0./Dist.: Sundargarh, PIN - 77000

E-mail: dpcsndgssa.opepa@nic.in, Phone: 06622273718
No. 1543/Pdg. Date: 17.05.2025

TENDER CALL NOTICE FOR SUPPLY OF
TEACHING LEARNING MATERIALS (TLM)

Sealed tender under two bid systems are invited from reputed
agency/suppliers/manufacturer having valid PAN, GST &
IT Clearance along with registration of firm etc. for supply of|
Teaching Learning Materials. The TLM consist of Slate, Pencil
Box, Chalk, Pencil, Eraser, Sharpener & Crayons for Shishu
Vatika and Pencil Box, Ruler, Pencil, Eraser, Sharpener and
Crayons for Grade |, Il & lll. The tender paper (bid documents)
containing detailed specification with terms & conditions,
application for technical and financial bid can be downioaded
from district website i.e. www.sundergarh.nic.in and OSEPA
website i.e. www.osepa.odisha.gov.in. The bidders are
required to submit Demand Draft of Rs.2000/- (Rupees two
thousand) only drawn in favour of District Project Coordinator,
SS, Sundargarh payable at Sundargarh towards cost of tender
documents which is non refundable. The last date and time
for receiving of tender paper is 30th May 2025 by 05.00 P.M.
and will be opened on 31.05.2025 at 10.00 A.M. in the Office
of the Collector, Sundargarh in the presence of bidders or
their authorized representative. Corrigendum/addendum if
required will be uploaded in the above website. Hence, the
potential bidders are requested go through the above website
for any updates. The authority reserves all the rights to reject/
modify or cancel part or whole tender without assigning any
reason thereof. By Order of

Collector-cum-Chairperson, SS, Sundargarh,
Sd./- DEO & DPC, SS, Sundargarh

aw

TATA
TATA STEEL LIMITED
Registered Office: Bombay House, 24, Homi Mody Street, Fort, Mumbai 400 001, India
Corporate Identification Number: L27100MH1907PLC000260
Tel No: +91 22 6665 8282 E-mail: cosec@tatasteel.com Website: www.tatasteel.com
wg
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SAMALESWAR! REGIONAL GO-OP NILK PRODUCERS' UNIONLD,
GOSHALA (BOUDIAPARAY PO KALAMAT, SAMBALPUR-16802

Phone: (0663) 2950426, Mob. No.: 9437122477
TENDER NOTICE

Sealed Techno Commercial offers in
Manufacturers/Supplier of following items:
Supply of 20 Sets Milk Testing Equipments, 20 Nos. Milk Analyser|
and 80 Nos. Aluminimum Milk Can - 40 Ltrs. capacity in different Milk
Producers’ Co-operative Societies under Multi Purpose Dairy Co-
operative Societies Scheme. The sealed technical & commercial bid
along with EMD of Rs.50,000.00 for MTE, Rs.50,000.00 for Milk analyser
and Rs.40,000.00 for Milk Can (inside commercial bid).

EMD in shape of Demand Draft drawn on any Nationalized Bank in favour
of Samaleswari Miltk Union payable at Sambalpur shall be received at
above address upto 5.00 P.M. on 05.06.2025 shall be opened at the
above address on Dt.06.06.2025 at 11.00 A.M. For details please visit
our website www.samul.in. No bid without required EMD shall be
accepted. Undersigned reserves the right to accept or reject any or all
the tenders or part thereof without assigning any reason.

Tender Paper Cost - Rs.1000/- + 18% GST = Rs. 1180/-.
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General Manager
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SAMALESWAR! REGIONAL GO-OP NILK PRODUCERS' UNIONLD,
GOSHALA (BOUDIAPARAY PO KALAMAT, SAMBALPUR-16802

Phone: (0663) 2950426, Mob. No.: 9437122477
TENDER NOTICE

Sealed Techno Commercial offers in sealed envelope from
Manufacturers/Supplier of following items:
Supply of 20 Sets Milk Testing Equipments, 20 Nos. Milk Analyser|
and 80 Nos. Aluminimum Milk Can - 40 Ltrs. capacity in different Milk
Producers’ Co-operative Societies under Multi Purpose Dairy Co-
operative Societies Scheme. The sealed technical & commercial bid
along with EMD of Rs.50,000.00 for MTE, Rs.50,000.00 for Milk analyser
and Rs.40,000.00 for Milk Can (inside commercial bid).
EMD in shape of Demand Draft drawn on any Nationalized Bank in favour
of Samaleswari Miltk Union payable at Sambalpur shall be received at
above address upto 5.00 P.M. on 05.06.2025 shall be opened at the
above address on Dt.06.06.2025 at 11.00 A.M. For details please visit
our website www.samul.in. No bid without required EMD shall be
accepted. Undersigned reserves the right to accept or reject any or all
the tenders or part thereof without assigning any reason.
Tender Paper Cost - Rs.1000/- + 18% GST = Rs. 1180/-.

General Manager

6010adae QIdieg, aleRIsHqd, aead
OFFICE OF THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL, PARALAKHEMUNDI, GAJAPATI

Ph. No.: 06815-222052, e-Mail: parala.mply@gmail.com
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SAMALESWAR! REGIONAL GO-OP NILK PRODUCERS' UNIONLD,
GOSHALA (BOUDIAPARAY PO KALAMAT, SAMBALPUR-16802

Phone: (0663) 2950426, Mob. No.: 9437122477
TENDER NOTICE

Sealed Techno Commercial
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Manufacturers/Supplier of following items:

Supply of 20 Sets Milk Testing Equipments, 20 Nos. Milk Analyser|
and 80 Nos. Aluminimum Milk Can - 40 Ltrs. capacity in different Milk
Producers’ Co-operative Societies under Multi Purpose Dairy Co-
operative Societies Scheme. The sealed technical & commercial bid
along with EMD of Rs.50,000.00 for MTE, Rs.50,000.00 for Milk analyser
and Rs.40,000.00 for Milk Can (inside commercial bid).

EMD in shape of Demand Draft drawn on any Nationalized Bank in favour
of Samaleswari Miltk Union payable at Sambalpur shall be received at
above address upto 5.00 P.M. on 05.06.2025 shall be opened at the
above address on Dt.06.06.2025 at 11.00 A.M. For details please visit
our website www.samul.in. No bid without required EMD shall be
accepted. Undersigned reserves the right to accept or reject any or all
the tenders or part thereof without assigning any reason.

Tender Paper Cost - Rs.1000/- + 18% GST = Rs. 1180/-.

offers in sealed envelope from

General Manager

2IPRNE 26910919 Q0

ZICANMAIR @R TR AR QIgAT AR |

G. 6%. AIQ. AIg, AT AAEG
@. 9. 6Q. QGG LT IS° @. 9.
6@. QAT 659262 ATAT IR
QTR @R FIAU (@ 26T
RALIRYR | 9 QUG @.
30! 9o 699R69 diRlegaal
QR A YA AAAER
6T 9 godle @RQIER
994 ¥Rl 928 edeeal
@ Y60 KT Q6
ARG AR A% ARIQ I

QQQI21 g9og 07dl QIR 9@ geagsl
QYR 6QRYNI | 6V @R IR FARS
QQUQI QYIER AV KA B 69QQ
AN RRgY 909g oSl 69I6a
@ 21ge AR | AARIQE A0RS!
e QAAIQE. ALRIEQ FIPAT R TR
QR U6QIARIQ VARG @R QERSIFI |,
TRTR AN QAR AV 62IRAEM | |-
Z6QIAPIQ U6Q QK1 TR SRY Sadll
(6 J9I8Q AAUARIN| Fa ARG
600QI T6Q 2Q1F BAPIF FAUAIRR! |

Letter No. 1509

QQUER UINTIRER ]

AR 6999 SI9

Q21T ALAYR QIS THR MY
20153 QS

6Q1RIS QG - 900/~ |

QIw - 900/-1
OIPR-13145/11/0018/2526

6010adae QIdieg, aleRIsHqd, aead
OFFICE OF THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL, PARALAKHEMUNDI, GAJAPATI

Ph. No.: 06815-222052, e-Mail: parala.mply@gmail.com

IRIAR
No C-342: N6RIal OGS 2869 Q9QRIGIR 299G Gr6s PaIn Sa101928 & 0Fe of adg)
9098 (88 QUG LAREH ATEQ ABFEE G2l FIRIEA AEA0IY FERS 8F TLIB G FERT
2201g 64016 0899q g W& oI Gzl QiEFra aea aIdea (GE0IRIR MBIB) STIRIR ARIR
Q6T aRIR SISAA FATIG AgR 4TI MPFOIg AAAYR UITIH SACI BAse BRI samaR|
QIR FRADIGER 6FET 6AINT GHIR CARTER FIF 1 I 60€ G UK 2°d gRd FawIg)
Qge 2188 6ACNER §.2,000.00&1 690 T §1C108I90980Iq NOIOBIFOIB ATRIL 109 . N0
adie @Idueaq 9998 QISR 1e° GINRIcRIT098 gaig .00 QYL YR (Speed Post/Register
Post) fIIFIEQ AQEG6E TLERI KYAT 26T IACH TR AFRTE CR6R 6QR FREIA 629
GIF 99”692 @@ 2Eg SINRICBIT0IS BARIL €9.9l0 UGl YA CEGRER B°E gadl Aes!
e 20FH6R 6694 SHINIIS | QRS 2SI €48 GIF FIAI6Q ANIRE Q1B §.2,00,000/-F1Q QU
QU VRRIEHGE L6 29l 62 6TIGE 10RRE SUIFER iKY AL AyRW, sdlaadee
QSGRICHGAE FINGE 65GR 6IUR A2 TIYR FR6T F663, AY 6596 ToIa] FAIT GIF | 2aae
GRicial 801 @8ze e @i 6rag §21d9 ) Qsdie 66a0 RIRLRI NG SoRIR 95aEI 218
ae 21660 630 aGQlg Sl 0F agd QIF 680 *GAIRER AIF 6969 GIRG 66@A 6UUQ
920 20150 I 2RIRER 99° TORE! CEUMUINIR 6548 Tolag FuIde | A6RIF 6998 QIFaS!
P 6199109190980IQ €010919098TY QS ARIGR 201G @89l AR 21694 SAIFR | e
35 adel 6dlQ0tET REAOT 29de 2661 671498 QI0Y QIR 6UY AAACA U GING 659
2608 on GUIRER | 19Ig gERad 6Fad 15 6F1ad FunIRasa 2Iga eaaaifiee @i
JRNG 212F QUGS QUYISS 69193 QOIEIINFT QIYIF 6 66iIR 6T1aT 5T @Gee 9iF | ¥ AAIRY
@6m 6010068 SOTq 4G AVISTIRIGIY 2TIR FuFe e 1§ AnGe Tlad 2EaIe gRe
GaIde AT 6RIRIE GRI8 FAINQIR PG N Agd YRR o2y 6TaaRNRa AIYRAca Sy

- Gw1€9,99 080/-

~ @@l g,000/-

- 9@l e,00,000/-
ARIGM A GL 1T
G2, KO, IR, 6o Q6T Gag -
Q6ll, SeA, FOI QEUIT Gag ~ 8o/~ 1
0. 6g9, O, GQ METIQ 62RAQ! FAT AEUDY G T8l 681¢ 6AIQIR IR €00/~ I QP

¥, Gy §R 68l - 019, Iade aeuRg 79 T8l 6816 6RIRIR IE Roo/~ I9° QG 6IRIF

9./~ QINEFIE RIS, sdleadas GIQQKGG‘AQQ

Dated: 17.05.2025|

98/-1




QIR 6QIFRNQ,

R 661, 9098

AL B4l | T

T
L

ARG FILIRIR FAIT 2ALFE QIARNER FHIE 6aNEE 3RRTRY AANYA A°YEER 53 AAULIRE | (61— Q. IFQ)

QAR QIBIEA

AARYR, er1R(R.9=Q)
@Sl 26gal 6 Qa8 QNI
AYQ GOIA TS F16RILQ 1AL
e Q901 2R 68| Rl
FIF6Q ¥GR QUIAT F1621AQ 629 |
RING ARY 961 NoQ AR 621R
QG AL RoGIER 688 62l

90 QIR | IeRQ QY QAsHe
QNGE 6291 TA6Q AN roIQ
eogl Mo AMS QAUTNRI AR
Je%e 6291 0ReeY ATNIRIQ
&2 Q814 gaIF 2Q AARYST AUVIER
QEg 629, U@ ARIA! QU
3 LY YoIA A ¥oal AL
QATY QFIZ @GRl AYY 6oR
F621I20Q  JoRgRl QAUUIRRI
R QNIg RGIEa AR
AR  QRR0IER LT

HRQQIel  AFRAIER T
F162120 @fcQ gt Leiee
IR QIR AR AR IR
OR8] 6 AULGR SLoEm,
QATRIRIER AT G GBI
C8 2PEasl 69IAIR A8 QU

dIR I wLQ

AARYR, eI 18(Q.IFR)
R G CI6aSdI AFOR AVQ
ZCAEE 2R AR QAI-9098
AR CPIPIGe F6eR T
QAR QRAIA NP  IFNER
UGHe 6RUIRE | ARIR 9FNQ TGl

Fa )

ey == == —

3600519

= T: $ ﬁ:{ a

sieQlsl C16wIge

PIREQ UTRY Q06| 6ILAR
FIQ AR TR QUCT, A Q1
AIGI Q16! PIRIER ARG 6269 |
F1621296Q AR A2 94 8
PUIe  ANGE R’ 96T
622 | QIR Q. YeRdl AIRINGT,
AANIQ RUILR FURIAUAS T,

QIR 65

AN2 ANGE 62RYR | 2R G
SI6QTEI QRO Yor) KIS
Ag, 28R U, GMAIe ol
3 YACRHOR LR IR 6AIRI 9°
6e8 QORI galig AAGH QSR |
Je @Rl 2R QIR Yo SFIER

ofolN

¥

QIS RIS 6256R RO BIgF ANES @QRT 202R |

AARYIR, € 1R(YEAIG QERIR)
P QARG FRRRIS 609 AVQ
NG FIIER JAIVIER SYR 62IRIS!
gl Aege! B ATk 219
AU AT QRRIQ ANRE
FAAGS| gl QIS KRR
6ag 90RAER ARITG F°. Falg
FRolw ARUTTRER ARG IR
AQER  ANER  JHHRIGEIRIER
IUPA 69 AR Q. YR
QIR 662, ARG 2i6e] D
/M A1 . RIQ FIQ A,
JETrAQ QREAILS 71, 90 Qe
QBE QIR AR, AR
gerle eI Qib,  QsieR
GREe JFRIUe Jg8 6QIseam
AMAIUIEF QLR AIFAQ
G T dE° QIR QI8 @1
AWEE R ANRIAUS
IIER L1RIGR B9 F19R FIHIFIR
RPN AR AR AL B IRIGI

Agew 9o | 62 Gl ARST 8K @Ml
FIRR6R TI0THI JL6 gl VUG
A0l QRIS 6RQER AR TV AR
R QOES| 900 0K AV
N godIe FRA QF gRIca galel
de R o83l AN
AR YELIIQ GEIQ QU8 DRI
QGIEM 1 90J6Q 69 AAIRIY IR
9Rdl digl, QUAVIL LRARIST
QYA FIRIB, ARAHOR Fe AR
e, PR AHGe 1Y, YA TR
6d0, S0Y AR TR AR,
CaRIR 99 TF, AeIRIe 924,
RS A, AN G, Al
Q. g, f6eR AERRR, @I
agll, g8l dFel Ag, gaQal
QI8, Geol AISIGIL!, AP GO,
QY Q1Y, dgal RIR, VWGB!
671629, YK AL IS QUL 2J6m |
6OIF6Q AYe AR A AR
Se0 MR XS QoleR |

AUNGA ANGE ASR0IEA ZICATE HIAQIG! AFRF1ER FIE FI6LIAGR GFIRE IQ AEFITR AAUNIAE |

qe €98 §o1a

6OFIR GE0R RULR AW
QloR, 6AglEHn Qg ol
QAR @R QRAERS!  gAR
2GIN, ANYA ATIRIQ GIF
AR 6QGgREl, GY1 F60Q
AN, AGE FERIQ A AV
QGG USRI 6T
QANGT QLRI 670 Q¥ GBI
QO] AR AT B8l FIQA IFQ
QAAPRIRTE TFYQUL ARIF-9098
dale QAR da QAR |

HIQRIG  AFRFNEQ 1621
o QU6 VTR QRIAR G,
UM QACAY R Q2R
78, 98 FINQ QRI8 62IGI, G
Qdl, 9OIR QPR IS F62IAQ
QR AN QR ARSI, 2QE!
IR A, FBIIQ 60, Y
FERFR AIFA QA IGGF @ AR
SMIGR QG IS QBYER1 TRIST
SO0 QAge 9F F16212RQ AeR
G0 QTA6Q ORI IIIR *TgeR |

2101 2IgA96a
Q@ €0

(145 9069 6240 0130 6991

MY, T 18(QQIRT SIFQ 6RUR)
QY QU 69 VS GLEl
d8Q AURYR FEGNAL G
YR 0RR6A SRR 699
FIRQ G081 NG 62RRE |
QUGG I 6ATR AR TR
LA IIFR ANAP GFIQ Qe
ARITERER  QIMGF 2GHe
caRemll @ Qigaea
2R gig SO dRiee
RS IR gsuRice) Ie°
QTG Y6 AR BESI
dis goia ggst Qe Qgie
M AR RUER 6AFERRIER |
@ 2306 60a9 QIeag
6dode QAR Gew

YRAQIB! IG° SIYR QSR A
2ice) FRITIQ QYR KoeleR |
LI FIR AR QS PR
geal iR 62 AITY AQeR

6QIm GO 268 ARIIQ Gl
PRRISSIER GRER | FLRIR
AADER FRRQIBIE Gl A1
AT UG 629l QR
6l g @l IR QIR
AIGETINE ARJeR | QINGE
Jiaaea Qoo el 9e°
6098 QIOew TECITRER
2ReRIER A1 IR @oal
A2 QISR A @ooER
(2 23AQ6Q 0Y SIS
TR FFIQ QI 625 FI0Q
AWR IR QUARAMI|
TR QMR YOI
JgSt 29GR FIOR AIGAQ QO
@oo6R | AAIGAG SRICR .
AN QIRILE OIge JORIRS!
QoM | (2 QAR AL
Qg Ewlal, AN el
HeQQIel ATM  6LIRIEM |

47

"\).

Q99 FUB1 AQAAER ABIAIR 25 I:° Q! |

Qg 81560 96 096 e 569

AARYQ/ AGAALIM, 0T 18
(6012 QEQIQ/QRICAIZE TGEF)  ARMYR, @ 1(YEAIR FERIR)
PRI T PAIGA  GR  AARGS AR

AUERER SRR QG IFAEER
@68 QEw gt ARl R
626M CFAAG! VTN CONGICT
QEAUAGIQ MUY JUR(99) |
LOEIgRER YeIgRl 6aIm @
aRIG AFRIN OgE  (esae
QG F0ES 1 63 6UIR Q@
TR @ FQ AR MIERD
de SR QRAsiely doRE|
fmeel 9ol agaId, QLRI
AMEQ  SHIAgER  6RIEd
RITEQ QRIQG VIR | ST
QAFVER 6 1@ ASTIN LITRER
deIRZER| T QI FIERQ
IS 9Q AER G AR |
TR6R ASEN GRER @ FIFR G
QteRI | @1d AFE AHe AQQ
Q@ 6TORIQ QI Q1 6 FIAAIQ!
6AIRIESE  Qoelem| QUG il
CGIER P KErm  CRIER
HOgeeE  cesee  degel
JOQ  6a¥RlR  AIRAER |

Q8 ARNIAQ QRIAR EHY QERE!

QNG NIl LR GerR IR
2IRg 9e¥R Rl A2 QI 6599
G8 2QUIQAQ AQIRA QLA Gty
QBRI gl | QAFEQ Q6ALQ,
AR, 6914, SFFAR, AR,
dg, TRRI, QBAGR, VAR

QqLe AN GEIE oIRGB Ul
T IR0 YRR FUAIRYR |
Adge SRR QAITER JAAER
R0 PRIINQ WP LRR IR
60Inl QIRYRI| 1@ QLR 6P
2IRRGIAR 2USAQ g6Y, ITIFIAl

6en fQ QUL 6 KRR
2R JRogeq V8 Q0RIQ
URPS! ARSI QRIS |
JoRIEAITY, 900¥EQ AR
8 Ceeudl AFOR Qe @
909060 Al  CAARYMII

A% (159 099 6l o gaal

ARG, e (Q.8=Q)
JPRIQ  6768Q RPN
(SNER) PP TRITER ‘LGP,
Qe 41Tk 2ICRIERINE QLRI
UGHe 6RKIRE] 2IENOAOFY
SN PG QRITR RN @.
IR FI RIP Q@I @
ANGIQ QIR I RAY
WA TQINIY VIR |
QLY TRIGIER GIRI AR
Jeoe g AN @I
P2AR J6O IR AGTeg X2
Qg 60¢ LIYARA FIAR FGA
cnlae Jo@iq RV R @.
QRIS MY @R IR
671620 QRN PERIA YRUTIER
JOG  QAUURR  AYARAER
26ee ghm IO Qeee e
deg; J2 QAN ¥ PR
WER geq CEie i
Qe g6RIgeR QUldRgl gie-
Joade Qnq bR 9o gouIQ,
G AQHEIQ 2K, [
IO QEIRRY  Uege
UGAY, CAREHIR  FIFTEARR
UHRQ ARYe Lo VIS,
dele oRde  6dlR, gIele
R gEbq ARUQ 6298 FGaIY
QWO YA LIg R

QPR DA AINFFEQ FIFIFIQ B 2UFFIER GR 69Yas |

409 86%IQ faeEn

TYLIRG Ged

QY [P, 6N I QIR
PIQICIER 2R GREQ (@
IARA 2N Qe |
@ QNG oA FWTR
SRITR IS° GIER @. UG AP,
TMQEE G0N, gorl a4, QRe
60, o QIOR, ARSI s,
6ARER a8, IR GFIQ OIR,

oBRdl 2igl, Fart AR, A
J1@ 62161, g9° AIg, Clae geaAR
dge Qdge oeml eRIeaIoy
69, NG B VUG AR YEND
QY 67 ereQ  AGLRL Ged
dRe QAN @ Gedq get
AR 6208 ANNER AIARAR
QUELITIG!, AYeR THFIL, ERIGE
CRIER GIIB Q° AREAICIP 67I2E0
ORIl 6709Y APRRY el
QM 861 6268 AIQN QLG GG Ie°
2 CoReRglR FRIER R0 @R |

JaARa o]  QKRIR
Qg GFIG6a ge gge R
o gy 6N @
a6V gass 6Ll
feasa gQ ©. @u6ee
67620  QIQIRIE 619
a8 caRem| AL 6a4l
d90 90Q QAW F0RER

6 QU9 AUEQ |IFIRIGT
QuIReem | IERISFIER
Q. 6299 QUIQ QaIol G
QAR AITEAIVT QFEFR
IR QARSI QU6
JIRIEAT Q6| 926Q
8¢ @4 BIQIRIQ AAYS J6m |
IR FETAQ Bl
Jde AR, JoFel A
ogR Q@9 4, JAIAMQR

R 8 QAAUGRRGIQ  qgaIRl T, & IS IR
QR 6ATEIRAER | AN
Ay TN 6216 YPRIRS!
QM| QR QIR
Qlg, AIAMAR 63N [N
4 9 eAIcERIER |

R 6 QUCLVG! A6
2900 Qe | RN
010 QUTER YA @.
e eolae QI
RO

52

o=

gesial

99 9go gatsl §@asa 6QISERl @Q8R 21918Ig |

SAMALESWAR! REGIONAL GO-OP NILK PRODUCERS' UNIONLD,
GOSHALA (BOUDIAPARAY PO KALAMAT, SAMBALPUR-16802

Phone: (0663) 2950426, Mob. No.: 9437122477
TENDER NOTICE

Sealed Techno Commercial offers in sealed envelope from
Manufacturers/Supplier of following items:
Supply of 20 Sets Milk Testing Equipments, 20 Nos. Milk Analyser|
and 80 Nos. Aluminimum Milk Can - 40 Ltrs. capacity in different Milk
Producers’ Co-operative Societies under Multi Purpose Dairy Co-
operative Societies Scheme. The sealed technical & commercial bid
along with EMD of Rs.50,000.00 for MTE, Rs.50,000.00 for Milk analyser
and Rs.40,000.00 for Milk Can (inside commercial bid).
EMD in shape of Demand Draft drawn on any Nationalized Bank in favour
of Samaleswari Miltk Union payable at Sambalpur shall be received at
above address upto 5.00 P.M. on 05.06.2025 shall be opened at the
above address on Dt.06.06.2025 at 11.00 A.M. For details please visit
our website www.samul.in. No bid without required EMD shall be
accepted. Undersigned reserves the right to accept or reject any or all
the tenders or part thereof without assigning any reason.
Tender Paper Cost - Rs.1000/- + 18% GST = Rs. 1180/-.

General Manager

6010adae QIdieg, aleRIsHqd, aead
OFFICE OF THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL, PARALAKHEMUNDI, GAJAPATI

Ph. No.: 06815-222052, e-Mail: parala.mply@gmail.com
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The Odisha State Co-operative Milk
Producers’ Federation Limited

D-2, Sahid Nagar, Bhubaneswar-751007
Ph. NO. : 0674-2546030, 2540273, 2540417, 2540974

www.omfed.com  E_mail ID : omfed@yahoo.com

e-Tender Notice
No.CAD-450 : OMFED invites Tender for Design, Development &
Implementation of Integrated Dairy Management System (IDMS)
along with Annual Operation & Maintenance support for 5 years
across various locations of OMFED. Interested bidders may submit
their offers latest by 05:00 P.M. dt. 05/06/2025. The cost of tender
paper is 11,800/~ (incl. GST 18%) along with EMD of 210,00,000/-
(Rupees Ten Lakhs Only) to be submitted online on the e-tender
portal of Government of Odisha (www.tendersodisha.gov.in)
in favor of OMFED payable at Bhubaneswar. For details visit out
official website: www.omfed.com.
The corrigendum / amendment to this notice, if required shall be
published only in the OMFED website and will not be published
again in newspaper.
OMFED reserves the right to accept or reject any or all the tenders
or part thereof without assigning any reason.

OIPR-06063/11/0180/2526

Sd./- Managing Director
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OFFICE OF THE PRRADEEP MUNICIPALITY, PARADEEP

FIe-aIGI, FRI-Fed ey, 98¥ey 9
At/Po.-Paradeep, Dist.-Jagatsinghpur (Odisha), Pin-754142
No.C-345 e-Procurement Notice
Tender Call Notice No. : 1980/dt.14.05.2025
Bid Identification No. : EQ/PDPM/W_01/2025-26
Tender ID 1 2025_ORULB_113460
Nature of Works : Civil Works
Number of Works : 130
Tender Value : ¥1.92 lakh to ¥ 16.95 lakh
Available Period 1 Dt.19.05.2025 from 10:00 hrs to
Dt.31.05.2025 17:00 hrs

Tender Opening Date : Dt.02.06.2025 at 11:00 A.M.
Bidders are requested to read the NIT & DTCN at www.
tendersodisha.gov.in _carefully and participate with their Supplier/
Manufacturer/fiicense with valid Registration Certificate before the
closing date.

$d./- Executive Officer

OIPR-13120/11/0042/2526 Paradeep Municipality

OFFICE OF THE CHIEF CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS CIRCLE, RAVAGADA

No.0-171:In Continuation to this office bid identification No.NCB-08/RWCRGDA/2025-28 invited vide this
office letter No.539 dated 11.04.2025 partial modification of TCN has been made as follows:

GOVERNIGENT OF ODISHA £mail ID-ccerwcrayagada@gmail.com

Letter No.81 _2, / Date:15.05.2025
1st Corrigendum

Sl

No. item

Time Schedule as per

Time Schedule as per Corrigendum
Original TCN i

Notice

No.T-ORIQ1 QIR Qg SARIQES  2R96
301628 FEIR TUYIRYUT 64, INILQ GHINRT AR
Q1 C.08.909¢8 Q¢ (FACINIR) TR AR I ATRIQ
286-9, 26dIR G9Q, YICRYAFE e AR
gefie Souea (qudem adal @eeg) olea
FEARIQEE TR ARVEAITR YIS @Q6 |

@ 2E6QIT I8 UIR ARG TIRAS AR Q!
SEARIQE 98196 9IF 91RI00E, UBIC 2R
gQ o2l G9] 2W6YIT 99 A2 EILIAYS N6
28100 UA96Q AUFE & GFQ ARWEAIG GHARIG
REIRAR6S | A06QIQ gIeg AT IR g 99de
QR 6210q 67IRIAM 619 IR AR 98 g A
QIR IR SIS gReQ CeB QTS |

UG e 6198 A8
QARIQE eI
8 QRIS YEELIT QIS

OIPR-09014/11/0121/2526

Availability of tender online for bidding

Dt.25.04.2025 at 11.00 AM to

Dt.16.05.2025 upto 5.00 PM Extended upto 5.00 PM of 06.06.2025

Date & Time of seeking tender clarification

Dt.15.05.2025 Upto 5.00 PM D1.05.06.2025 Upto 5.00 PM

‘9e QTRQ go® 3

{Technical Bid)

Date & Time of opening of tender

Dt.17.05.2025 At 11.00 AM. Dt.09.06.2025, At 11.00 A.M.

Date & Time of opening of tender (Price Bid)

Will be intimated Jater on to the
successful bidders

Will be intimated fater on o
the successful bidders

OIPR-25196/11/0013/2526

All other terms & conditions will remain unchanged.
8d./- Chief Construction Engineer, Rural Works Circle, Rayagada

alaatay

699 QM FIA FAUAIR

www.bdabrahmapur.in, e-mail: bedaengineers@gmail.com; Phone No.0680 2292797

NATIONAL COMPETITIVE BIDDING THROUGH e-PROCUREMENT

Invitation for Bids (IFB)

- No.CAD-442
geal QAUILIRGYM | No. 176/BeDA (Engg.), Dt.16.05.2025
2ATINQ FELIR Q@@@’ ' i Estimat- . Availability ofBifi Name &
~  ~ < Sl Name of work Bid Identifi-) ed Cost | Class of Period of Document for Online Address of
Q]ﬁ@ LLFIMQA RY @€l @4 No. cationNo. | (Rs.in | Contractor | Completion Bidding Officer Inviting
06ee! ST QAR |t Lakh) From To Bid
ﬂQJ@ CQEedl gaal e Development of Waer | EM-BeDA- “B” Class or 09 (Nine) | 13.05.2025 | 09.06.2025 >%
al GS ﬂl’ ca9lo Ql @ﬁ@ | \,@ Sports Complex at 12/2025-26 24448 Equivalent Cn;(l):‘:ﬁ:r :lg::)s QZ:& g '::;- 5 E
b Gi o SN Sonapur, Ganjam 3583 E]
7Y 99 QRIS YR AR 2 |Infrastructure at § < g 2
So
Qe G219 912 AN QS Sea Beaches for EM- wew 06(Six) [19.05.2025] 09.06.2025 | =~ & 2 5
] easy access to the C” Class or o593
~ = diff tly abled BeDA-13/ | 21.18 Equivalent Calendar 10.00 17.30 ggeyg
FEE2 | AR RQ VR ifrerently able 202526 quivaien Months Hours | Hours | S %3
~ © people at Gopalpur, S
L 6996Q 6K¢19@Q R Ganjam i

AL 9/ AR 6669
Jeeel gl Qdeleew
gae aqg aAmcl aagl

All Corrigendum and addendum shail be published in official website only.

The Bidder shall have to participate in ONLINE bidding only.

Late date for seeking clarification - Dt.30.05.2025 upto 17.30 hours.

Further details can be seen from the e-Procurement portal www.tendersodisha.gov.in and www.bdabrahmapur.in.
Tender shall be opened online on Dt.10.06.2025 at 11 hours.

DISTRICT EDUCATION OFFICE, SAMBALPUR

(DISTRICT PROJECT MANRGEMENT UNIT, PM Poshan)
No. 4112/PM POSHAN (MDM) Dt.16/05/2025

SHORT TENDER CALL NOTICE

No.n-48 : Sealed tenders are invited in the prescribed format from
the intending individual / firm/ Transport Contractor(s) / Agents
having agent’s license for transportation of foodstuff(rice) under
PM Poshan feeding programme from OSCSC RRC godowns i.e.
A.Katapali, Nuakhurigaon, Kuchinda & Rairakhol of the district to
different school points of Sambalpur District without transit for 3
& 4™ qtr of 2025-26. The detailed tender papers and documents can
be obtained from the District Project Management Unit, PM Poshan
(MDM), which is functioning in the Office of the District Education
Officer, Sambalpur on payment of Rs.500/- (Rupees Five Hundred)
only (non-refundable) in shape of Demand Draft in favour of the
“District Education Officer-cum-District Nodal Officer, District
Project Management Unit, PM Poshan(MDM), Sambalpur”
payable at Sambalpur. The details of the Tender Call Notice and other
documents are also available in Office website http://sambalpur.
odisha.gov.in of Sambalpur District.

Date of commencement of sale of Tender : Dt.17.05.2025
Document

Last date of sale of Tender Document
Last date & time of Receipt of Tender
Documents

Date & Time of Opening of Tender
Docuemnts

: D1.31.05.2025
: D1.03.06.2025 (1 P.M.)

. Intimated Later on

Notwithstanding anything contained to the contrary in the tender
document, the undersigned reserves the right to cancel/modify the
“invitation for Bids” or to reject any or all of the bids or cancel the
entire tender process without assigning any reason thereof and shall
bear no liability whatsoever consequent upon such a decision.

Sd./- District Education Officer |-

AIAEQ IR QN 64 @LRB | |OIPR-13086/11/0006/2526 Sd./- ENGINEER MEMBER, Brahmapur Development Authority, Brahmapur| { OIPR-15013/11/0051/2526 Sambalpur
©
GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA GOVERNMENT OF ODISHA 3
<
OFFIGE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER, RURAL WORKS DIVISION-1I, MALKANGIRI DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
E-mail-ruralworksdivisioniimalkangiri@yahoo.in OFFICE OF THE ADDITIONAL CHIEF ENGINEER =
INVITATION FOR BIDS
EASTERN CIRCLE-l, CANTONMENT ROAD, CUTTACK
NATIONAL COMPETITIVE BIDDING . g - ’
Bid ldentification No: RWDSE_MKG_li_ONLINE_02/2025-26 Email id : seeccuttack ——
id ldentification No: | i A 5 . .
No.0O-169:The Superintending Engineer, Rural Works Division-il, Malkangiri on behalf of Governor of Odisha invites from e’-Procurement Notice NOACE’ EC-1/01 of 2025-26
bidders of eligible class registered with the State Government and bidders of equivalent Grade/Class registered with Central | 1|1 {Name of Work : { Protection to scoured bank on Kathajodi left embankment of 4 new nos.
Government/MES/Railways according to the norm of “e” Procurement system in online mode for the works detailed in the table low level spur at RD 4,650 km, at RD 4.890 km, RD 5.070 km and at RD
below on turnkey basis. 5.350 km with faunching apron near Birenmitra Park.
1. Name of the Work: Building & Road Work. 2. No. of Works: 03 Nos. 3. Estimated Cost: Rs.58.83 Lakhs to 81.39 Lakhs. 4. Bid Identification No.ACE, EC-1 MBD 01 of 2025-26
Tender Paper Cost: Rs.10,000/-. 5. Class of Contractor: Estimated Cost upto Rs.20.00 Lakhs ‘D', Estimated Cost upto Rs.40.00 | }|2 | Total No. of Work 1{1 (One) No. work
Lakhs ‘C’, Estimated Cost more than Rs.20.00 lakhs & within Rs.300.00 lakhs ‘B’. 6. Period of Completion: 08 (Nine) Calendar § |3 | Tender paper Cost (online) (Non-refundable) |: jRs. 10,000.00 (Ten thousand)
Months. 7. Critical Dates: 4. Bid details are as foliows :
Procurement Officer Bid identification|  Availability of Tender Last Date & Date of Opening of Tender Bid Tender Cost ) Availability of Tender Date of
No. Online for Bidding Time of Seeking Procurement identification | (Rs. in Lakh) .EMD. {On- | Class of Period gf On-line for bidding Opeplng of
From To Tender Technical Bid] Financial Bid Officer No. (Approx.) line) (in Rs.) | Contractor | Completion From To Technical Bid
Clarification _ (Cover-)
Superintending Engineer, | RWDSE_MKG_ | 26.05.2025 | 10.06.2025 | 09.06.2025 11.06.2025 |To be intimated Additional ACE, ECH o 12 (Twelve [20.05.2025]03.06.2025
Rural Works Division-ll, | 1f_ONLINE_02 at upto upto 3.00 PM |at 11.00AM.| separately Chief Engineer, | \ian'o1of | 827.00  |8.27,00000| A% | Calendar at upto | 04062025
Malkangiri 0f2025-26 | 11.00AM. | 0530 PM Fastorn Swdle. | 202526 Special’ | onths) | 10.00 hrs. | 17.30 hrs, | 3 1130 hrs.
Further details can be seen in the bidding documents, which is available in the e-procurement portal https:/fwww. om tuttac 3 v T the Govt bsit tond dish -
tendersorissa.gov.in. < Subsequent corrigendum if required shall be appeared in the website. “Authority reserves the right fo er terms and conaitions can be seen from the Sovt. websiie Www,[eNdersodisna.gov.in
N . P All corrigendum / cancellation of tender if any, will only be uploaded in the above website.
reject any or ail tenders without assigning any reason thereof. Sd.J- Additional Chief Engineer.
OIPR-25079/11/0024/2526 Sd./- Superintending Engineer, Rural Works Division-ll, Malkangiri | | 0IPR-32370/11/0016/2526 Eastern Circle-l, Cuttack

No.C-338

OFFICE OF THE
MUNICIPAL COUNCIL: GUNUPUR

e-procurement Notice
Tender Reference No.GUN-MUN-70/2025-26
No.855, Dt.16.05.2025

01. |Total Nos. of Works ;103 Nos. of Civil Works
02. |Approximate Estimated Cost |: |Rs.62,65,930/- to
(including GST 18%) Rs.84,27,810/-
03. |Period of Completion 1| Three {03) - Six (06)
Months
04. |Date & Time of availability of |: |10.00 Hrs. of D1.19.05.2025
Bid document in the Portal t0 17.00 Hrs. of
Ditd.06.06.2025 for Online
Bidding
05. |Last date/Time for receipt of |:[17.00 Hrs. of
Bids in the Portal Dtd.06.06.2025
08. |Name and address of the . |[Executive Officer,
Officer Inviting Bid Gunupur Municipality
07. |Date of Opening of Bids 1111.00 Hrs. on
Dtd.09.06.2025
08. {Further details can be seen|: iwww.tendersodisha.gov.in
from the e-Procurement Por-
tal
09. {Further Addendum/ Corrigendum if any will be hosted in the
above website.

Sd./- Executive Officer

OIPR-13104/11/0014/2526 Gunupur Municipality

No.A-187

GOVERNMEN
DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES

INVITATION FOR BIDS (IFB)
“e” Procurement Notice-1/2025-26
BID IDENTIFICATION NO.SAL-BDK-1-P1 OF 2025-26

1. Name of Work . Maintenance of Canal and
Embankment (River & Saline)
Works

_ 6361 20919 NoAes
AIBE LRIF ARG, 2GR 60T FAIRE

asam-akp.irrigationdivision@gmail.com
‘e’- Procurement Notice No.03/2025-26

1. QIS QIS : RQ1 9T AQUNE RIY
2, 6RIC QIS QO : 09 GQIE QI
3. 2ORe amy : 98,80 QNG FN.09 R
4. @.40.% (Bid Security) : The bidder shal transfer the required amount
3 @6 JRYQ 698 gt of EMD (Bid Security) and cost of Bid
by Oniline through electronic payment
as per Govt. of Odisha WDOM
No.17254/WE Dated 05.12.2017 as
Mentioned in DTCN.
5 QI Qg ang : 9
6. GORNO QRERIGINY GRS -
. Procurement Officer : TRNKS IR/,
UGPADD FFEASE FRSR, AYANTN
Il 2eRee Bidding® QAaQIfl: €1L.90.08.9098 &1 eo aalg
B1L9¢.08.909% ANl $ b adue
Ill.  Technical \9e° Financial bid: 2196 Q&1, 2P SREAGR
SHIRIERIR 18 6 ANG FRIRER FITHIRAEA B1LM0.08.9098
aq1ee.Mmo
V. Transparent Lottery@ : TRUINE GR1, YA eRedor
GG 6 ang SRIFET FITIRAERSL09.09,9098

Qa1 ee.00 QORI AR |
2AQUIRY 2 I8 63RANCED gRIe SRS www.tendersorissa.gov.in
gl./~ AN Ta)
YS! FREATR ISR,
UGN

OIPR-32548/11/0002/2526

2. Class of Contractor : Varies from “C” Class to “B” Class
3. No. of Works . 8 Nos. (Details as per NIT
available in website)
4. Value of Work : Rs.49.00 Lakhs to 10.27 Lakhs
5. Time of Completion : 4 to 6 Calendar Months
6. Type of Bid . Percentage Bid
7. Summary for key dates is provided below.
p Bid Availability of tender for |Date & Time
rocurement o ) i .
Officer Id_entlf;ca— online bidding of opening
tion No. From To Bid
Superintendig
Engineer, SAL-  |22.05.202505.06.2025| 06.06.2025
Salandi Canal | BDK-1 P1 at upto at
Division, of 2025-26| 11.00 AM 1.00 PM 11.00 AM
Bhadrak

Further details can be seen from the website hitp.//www.
tendersodishagov.in/ www.dowrodisha.gov.in.
Any addenduny/ Corrigendum/Cancellation to the above notice will
be published in this website only.

Sd./- Superintending Engineer
OIPR-320056/11/0006/2526 Salandi Canal Division, Bhadrak

Government of Odisha
Office of the Superintending Engineer,
Rural Works Division-ll, Dhenkanal

No.0-174 Kamakhyanagar
E-Mail : rw.kamakhyanagar@yahoo.co.in

e-procurement Notice No. 01 / Building Work / 2025-26
Name of the work 1 |Building Work
Total No. of Works 1102 (Two) Nos.
Tender Cost :|Rs. 50.42 lakh (approx)
Class of Contractor :|“B” Class
Period of Completion 1|6 calendar months
Availability of Tender :1123.05.2025 at 11.00 A.M. to
online for bidding 31.05.2025 up to 5.00 P.M.
Last Date & Time of :130.05.2025 upto 4.00 P.M.
seeking tender clarification
Date & Time of opening
of Bid

Other Details can be seen from the website
http://tendersorissa.gov.in.

3
2
3
4
5
6

~

8 :102.06.2025 at 11.00 A.M.

Sd./- Superintending Engineer
R.W. Division-}l, Dhenkanal

OIPR-25094/11/0025/2526 Kamakhyanagar

ODISHA PUBLIG SERVICE COMMISSION
CUTTACK

NOTICE
No. 3309/P.S.C., Dt. 17.05.2025
(1R-05-2025/26)(DR-V)
No.D-62 : It is for information of all concerned that, document verification of
candidates having PPSAN mentioned below for the Post of Professor in
Metallurgical & Material Engineering, pursuant to Advertisement No.31
of 2023-24 shall be held on 28.05.2025 as per the following programme in
the Office of the Commission at 19, Dr. P. K. Parija Road, Cuttack - 753001.
PROGRAMME OF DOCUMENT VERIFICATION

s

(S

ODISHA PUBLIC SERVIGE COMMISSION
CUTTACK

NOTICE
No. 3303/P.S.C., Dt. 17.05.2025
(1R-07-2025/26)(DR-V)
No.D-61 : It is for information of all concerned that, document verification
of candidates having PPSAN mentioned below for the Post of Professor
in Production Engineering, pursuant to Advertisement No.31 of 2023-24
shall be held on 28.05.2025 as per the following programme in the Office of
the Commission at 19, Dr. P. K. Parija Road, Cuttack - 753001.
PROGRAMME OF DOCUMENT VERIFICATION

Time of PPSAN

Time of PPSAN

Date I
verification
28.05.2025| 2.30 PM. {P240312208 & P240293819 = 02 Candidates

Date verification
28.05.2025| 10.30 A.M. 1P240302121 & P240304475 = 02 Candidates

The candidates are required to submit the following documents (both
original & one set of photo-copies) at the time of verification :-
1. The hard copies of online application forms indicating their PPSAN at
the top right-hand corner.
Four recent passport size photographs (unsigned & unattested) which
has been uploaded with online application form.
3. Duly filled in & attested “Attestation Form” and duly filled in “Bio-data
Form” (downloaded from the website of the Commission).
H.S.C. or equivalent Certificate in support of declaration of age issued
by the concerned Board /Council.
5. Bachelor’s Degree (BE/B.Tech.) Certificate issued by the recognized
University in the relevant branch.
6. M.E/M.Tech. /M.S./Integrated M. Tech Certificate issued by the
recognized University in the relevant branch.
7. Ph.D. Degree Certificate.
8. Mark-lists in support of all the aforesaid examinations (i.e. H.S.C. to
Ph.D.) issued by the concerned Board /Council/ University /institution.
9. Research Papers.
Research Publications.
. Experience Certificate indicating minimum 10 years of experience in
teaching/research/industry.
. Experience Certificate in support of having minimum of 03 years of
experience at a post equivalent to that of an Associate Professor (Level-
13A1, Entry pay-131400).
Certificates/documents indicating about successfully guiding doctoral
candidates.
Caste Certificate wherever applicable.
No Objection Certificate from the competent authorities in case of
Government Servants.
16. Any proof of identity.
17. Copies of all the documents in support of Research Score as provided
in Annexure-A (Table-2) of Advt. No.31 of 2023-24.
Any other documents as mentioned in para-09 of Advt. No.31 of 2023-
24
The candidates are advised to report in the Office of the Commission
half an hour before the commencement of verification on the scheduled
date & time as mentioned above.
Note :- it is also made clear that the candidature of these candidates for
the recruitment is purely provisional. The candidature is liable for rejection
in the event of inadequacy/ deficiency found at any stage during or after the
selection process and is subject to fulfillment of the terms and conditions laid
down in the Advertisement. Mere participation in the document verification
does not reserve any right for selection.

2.

13.

14.
15.

18.

OIPR-12002/11/0209/2526 Sd./- Secretary

The candidates are required to submit the following documents (both
original & one set of photo-copies) at the time of verification :-
1. The hard copies of online application forms indicating their PPSAN at
the top right-hand corner.
Four recent passport size photographs (unsigned & unattested) which
has been uploaded with online application form.
3. Duly filled in & attested “Attestation Form” and duly filled in “Bio-data
Form” (downloaded from the website of the Commission).
H.S.C. or equivalent Certificate in support of declaration of age issued
by the concerned Board /Council.
5. Bachelor’s Degree (BE/B.Tech.) Certificate issued by the recognized
University in the relevant branch.
6. M.E/M.Tech. /M.S./Integrated M. Tech Certificate issued by the
recognized University in the relevant branch.
7. Ph.D. Degree Certificate.
8. Mark-lists in support of all the aforesaid examinations (i.e. H.S.C. to
Ph.D.) issued by the concerned Board /Council/ University /Institution.
9. Research Papers.
Research Publications.
. Experience Certificate indicating minimum 10 years of experience in
teaching/research/industry.
. Experience Certificate in support of having minimum of 03 years of
experience at a post equivalent to that of an Associate Professor (Level-
13A1, Entry pay-131400).
Certificates/documents indicating about successfully guiding doctoral
candidates.
Caste Certificate wherever applicable.
No Objection Certificate from the competent authorities in case of
Government Servants.
16. Any proof of identity.
17. Copies of all the documents in support of Research Score as provided
in Annexure-A (Table-2) of Advt. No.31 of 2023-24.
Any other documents as mentioned in para-09 of Advt. No.31 of 2023-
24
The candidates are advised to report in the Office of the Commission
half an hour before the commencement of verification on the scheduled
date & time as mentioned above.
Note :- It is also made clear that the candidature of these candidates for
the recruitment is purely provisional. The candidature is liable for rejection
in the event of inadequacy/ deficiency found at any stage during or after the
selection process and is subject to fulfillment of the terms and conditions laid
down in the Advertisement. Mere participation in the document verification
does not reserve any right for selection.
OIPR-12002/11/0211/2526

2.

13.

14.
15.

18.

Sd./- Secretary
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AFFIDAVIT

By virtue of an affidavit

sworn before Notary,
dated 03.05.2025,
I, Gouranga Charan
Pradhan, Address-
Plot No.- 1595 (B),
Sasanpadia, Old Town,
Bhubaneswar- 751002
declare that | have
changed my daughter’s
name from Subhashree
Priyadarshini  Pradhan
to Subhashree
Priyadarsini. Henceforth,
she shall be known as
Subhashree Priyadarsini
for all purposes.

Gouranga Charan Pradhan
D-595

By virtue of an affidavit
bearing SI.No.-536, dt
06.05.25 before the
Executive Magistrate,
Ghatgaon, |, Sh. Puria
Nayak, S/o- Birabar
Nayak, Permanent
Resident of  Village-
Sanabarabeda, P.O.-
Sanamasinabilla,
P.S.-Ghatgaon, Dist.-
keonjhar,Odisha, PIN-
758029  declare as
under. That my daughter
Manjari Nayak was born
at Ghatgaon C.H.C on dt-
25.12.2008 and as per her
Birth Cerificate issued by
the competent authorities
the name is Manjari
Nayak. But inadvertently
in her Aadhaar Card the
name has been mentioned
as Pujarani Nayak. | want
that her original name
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By virtue of an affidavit

before Executive
Magistrate, Nayagarh,
dated 14.05.2025, |,

Rajendra Pradhan, Vill-
Lunisara, P.O.- Sikrida,
P.S.- Nuagaon, Dist.-
Nayagarh, Odisha, PIN-
752083 declare that |
have changed my son’s
name from R.L. Ronak
to RL Ronak Pradhan.
Henceforth, he shall be
known as RL Ronak
Pradhan for all future
purposes.

Rajendra Pradhan
D-605

By virtue of an affidavit
it declares that Saijid
Mahammad, S/o- Late
Mohammad Ajij and
Sajid Mohammad, S/o-
Late Mohammad Ajij is
same and one person
of Paikarapur, Chhatia,

Jajpur. D-604
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